
Memphis Shelby County Schools (MSCS) 
Division of Nutrition Services

2025 - 2026 1st Semester Canned and Pouch Bid
July 31, 2025 - December 12, 2025
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A B C D E F G H I J K L M N O

Stock 
Number Unit Description                                                            Approved Brands

(Manufacture Product Code)
  2025-2026 SY Estimated Cases

July 31, 2025 - December 12, 2025       
Bidder

 
Manufacturer's 

Product
Code

Bidder's
Brand & Product Code

Bidder's
Terms Pack Size Cost            

per Case
Extended Total          

Cost
Lead Time Comments AWARDS

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 Column 5 Column 6 Column 7 Column 8 Column 9 Column 10 Column 11 Column 12 Column 13 Column 14 Column 15

Bid Submissions That Deviate From What Is Being 
Requested In The Specifications Below Will Be 

Considered A Non Acceptable Vendor Response.

** Indicates available USDA commodity may 
impact actual usage quantities. 

DELIVERIES BEGIN 07/31/2025 THRU 
12/12/2025 

FALL BREAK OCTOBER 13-17 - NO 
DELIVERIES THIS WEEK

THANKSGIVING BREAK NOVEMBER 24-28 - 
NO DELIVERIES THIS WEEK 

CHRISTMAS BREAK DECEMBER 22, 2025- 
JANUARY 5, 2026

Pack Sizes listed in the specs are 
reflective of the current awarded 

brand, all pack sizes will be thoroughly 
evaluated for approval. 

Items listed are Pre-Approved 
Brands. MSCS will accept an 

item: (1) as long as it meets the 
bid specification and (2) tested 
and approved through MSCS's 

Sample Submission Process.

ALL SHIP 
LOTS ARE IN 

CASES.

1152 CASE

Fruit Cocktail, Canned - Packed to U.S. Grade B 
standards or better. Contains peaches, pears, grapes, 
pineapple and cherries packed in 100% juice.  Packed: 
6/#10 cans/case.  Minimum Drained Weight: 72 oz. 

Ship Lot:  952

Port Royal Premium 19211-53305
Del Monte 2001651
Ambrosia 14970
Sunfield 703072

2856 CHURCHFIELD 
TRADING 

2001651 -
repl 2005695 DEL MOTNE NET 30 6/ #10 $55.23 $157,736.88 14 DAYS 

1152 CASE

Fruit Cocktail, Canned - Packed to U.S. Grade B 
standards or better. Contains peaches, pears, grapes, 
pineapple and cherries packed in 100% juice.  Packed: 
6/#10 cans/case.  Minimum Drained Weight: 72 oz. 

Ship Lot:  952

Port Royal Premium 19211-53305
Del Monte 2001651
Ambrosia 14970
Sunfield 703072

2856 Robbins Sales 
Co. Inc. 19211-53305 Port Royal Premium 

19211-53305
Net 30 6/#10 $41.90 $119,666.40 21 Days AWARD

1152 CASE

Fruit Cocktail, Canned - Packed to U.S. Grade B 
standards or better. Contains peaches, pears, grapes, 
pineapple and cherries packed in 100% juice.  Packed: 
6/#10 cans/case.  Minimum Drained Weight: 72 oz. 

Ship Lot:  952

Port Royal Premium 19211-53305
Del Monte 2001651
Ambrosia 14970
Sunfield 703072

2856
Schreiber Foods 

International, 
Inc

14970 Ambrosia net 30 days 6/#10 $43.40 $123,950.40 7-10 days

1164 CASE

Fruit, Tropical - Packed to U.S. Grade B standard or 
better, 6/#10 cans/case, must contain pineapple, red 
papaya, and yellow papaya, can be packed in light 
syrup and/or natural fruit juice.  Minimum Drained 
Weight: 72 oz. 

Ship Lot: 476 

Dole - 38900 09082
Lolita
Port Royal 19211-53350
Sunfield 703072
Shreiber/Ambrosia 14941 2856 CHURCHFIELD 

TRADING OHTFS610 OUR HOUSE  
OHTFS610

NET 30 6/ #10 $39.39 $112,497.84 14 DAYS 

2025-2026 SY Can-Pouch Bid I 



Memphis Shelby County Schools (MSCS) 
Division of Nutrition Services

2025 - 2026 1st Semester Canned and Pouch Bid
July 31, 2025 - December 12, 2025
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Stock 
Number Unit Description                                                            Approved Brands

(Manufacture Product Code)
  2025-2026 SY Estimated Cases

July 31, 2025 - December 12, 2025       
Bidder

 
Manufacturer's 

Product
Code

Bidder's
Brand & Product Code

Bidder's
Terms Pack Size Cost            

per Case
Extended Total          

Cost
Lead Time Comments AWARDS

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 Column 5 Column 6 Column 7 Column 8 Column 9 Column 10 Column 11 Column 12 Column 13 Column 14 Column 15

Bid Submissions That Deviate From What Is Being 
Requested In The Specifications Below Will Be 

Considered A Non Acceptable Vendor Response.

** Indicates available USDA commodity may 
impact actual usage quantities. 

DELIVERIES BEGIN 07/31/2025 THRU 
12/12/2025 

FALL BREAK OCTOBER 13-17 - NO 
DELIVERIES THIS WEEK

THANKSGIVING BREAK NOVEMBER 24-28 - 
NO DELIVERIES THIS WEEK 

CHRISTMAS BREAK DECEMBER 22, 2025- 
JANUARY 5, 2026

Pack Sizes listed in the specs are 
reflective of the current awarded 

brand, all pack sizes will be thoroughly 
evaluated for approval. 

Items listed are Pre-Approved 
Brands. MSCS will accept an 

item: (1) as long as it meets the 
bid specification and (2) tested 
and approved through MSCS's 

Sample Submission Process.

ALL SHIP 
LOTS ARE IN 

CASES.

9

10

11

12

13

1164 CASE

Fruit, Tropical - Packed to U.S. Grade B standard or 
better, 6/#10 cans/case, must contain pineapple, red 
papaya, and yellow papaya, can be packed in light 
syrup and/or natural fruit juice.  Minimum Drained 
Weight: 72 oz. 

Ship Lot: 476 

Dole - 38900 09082
Lolita
Port Royal 19211-53350
Sunfield 703072
Shreiber/Ambrosia 14941 2856 Robbins Sales 

Co. Inc. 19211-53350 Port Royal Premium 
19211-53350

Net 30 6/#10 $37.90 $108,242.40 21 Days AWARD

1164 CASE

Fruit, Tropical - Packed to U.S. Grade B standard or 
better, 6/#10 cans/case, must contain pineapple, red 
papaya, and yellow papaya, can be packed in light 
syrup and/or natural fruit juice.  Minimum Drained 
Weight: 72 oz. 

Ship Lot: 476 

Dole - 38900 09082
Lolita
Port Royal 19211-53350
Sunfield 703072
Shreiber/Ambrosia 14941 2856

Schreiber Foods 
International, 

Inc
14941 Ambrosia net 30 days 6/#10 $48.05 $137,230.80 7-10 days

1164 CASE

Fruit, Tropical - Packed to U.S. Grade B standard or 
better, 6/#10 cans/case, must contain pineapple, red 
papaya, and yellow papaya, can be packed in light 
syrup and/or natural fruit juice.  Minimum Drained 
Weight: 72 oz. 

Ship Lot: 476 

Dole - 38900 09082
Lolita
Port Royal 19211-53350
Sunfield 703072
Shreiber/Ambrosia 14941 2856 Sysco Memphis 

LLC 09082 Dole - 4989604 NET30 6/10# $57.38 $163,877.28 2-weeks

1165 CASE

Peaches Slices, Canned - Packed to U.S. Grade B 
standard or better, 6/#10 cans per case, packed in 
100% fruit juice  juice.  Minimum Drained Weight: 65 
oz.  

Ship Lot: 952 

Port Royal Premium 19211-28045
Del Monte 2001676
Sunfield 703107
Our House OHPS610

1,904 CHURCHFIELD 
TRADING OHPS610 OUR HOUSE  

OHPS610
NET 30 6/ #10 $44.29 $84,328.16 14 DAYS

2025-2026 SY Can-Pouch Bid I 



Memphis Shelby County Schools (MSCS) 
Division of Nutrition Services

2025 - 2026 1st Semester Canned and Pouch Bid
July 31, 2025 - December 12, 2025

1
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A B C D E F G H I J K L M N O

Stock 
Number Unit Description                                                            Approved Brands

(Manufacture Product Code)
  2025-2026 SY Estimated Cases

July 31, 2025 - December 12, 2025       
Bidder

 
Manufacturer's 

Product
Code

Bidder's
Brand & Product Code

Bidder's
Terms Pack Size Cost            

per Case
Extended Total          

Cost
Lead Time Comments AWARDS

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 Column 5 Column 6 Column 7 Column 8 Column 9 Column 10 Column 11 Column 12 Column 13 Column 14 Column 15

Bid Submissions That Deviate From What Is Being 
Requested In The Specifications Below Will Be 

Considered A Non Acceptable Vendor Response.

** Indicates available USDA commodity may 
impact actual usage quantities. 

DELIVERIES BEGIN 07/31/2025 THRU 
12/12/2025 

FALL BREAK OCTOBER 13-17 - NO 
DELIVERIES THIS WEEK

THANKSGIVING BREAK NOVEMBER 24-28 - 
NO DELIVERIES THIS WEEK 

CHRISTMAS BREAK DECEMBER 22, 2025- 
JANUARY 5, 2026

Pack Sizes listed in the specs are 
reflective of the current awarded 

brand, all pack sizes will be thoroughly 
evaluated for approval. 

Items listed are Pre-Approved 
Brands. MSCS will accept an 

item: (1) as long as it meets the 
bid specification and (2) tested 
and approved through MSCS's 

Sample Submission Process.

ALL SHIP 
LOTS ARE IN 

CASES.

14

15

16

17

18

1165 CASE

Peaches Slices, Canned - Packed to U.S. Grade B 
standard or better, 6/#10 cans per case, packed in 
100% fruit juice  juice.  Minimum Drained Weight: 65 
oz.  

Ship Lot: 952 

Port Royal Premium 19211-28045
Del Monte 2001676
Sunfield 703107
Our House OHPS610

1,904 Robbins Sales 
Co. Inc. 19211-28045 Port Royal Premium 

19211-28045
Net 30 6/#10 $41.48 $78,977.92 21 Days AWARD

1165 CASE

Peaches Slices, Canned - Packed to U.S. Grade B 
standard or better, 6/#10 cans per case, packed in 
100% fruit juice  juice.  Minimum Drained Weight: 65 
oz.  

Ship Lot: 952 

Port Royal Premium 19211-28045
Del Monte 2001676
Sunfield 703107
Our House OHPS610

1,904
Schreiber Foods 

International, 
Inc

38422 Ambrosia net 30 days 6/#10 $40.45 $77,016.80 7-10 days NO SAMPLE SENT 

1165 CASE

Peaches Slices, Canned - Packed to U.S. Grade B 
standard or better, 6/#10 cans per case, packed in 
100% fruit juice  juice.  Minimum Drained Weight: 65 
oz.  

Ship Lot: 952 

Port Royal Premium 19211-28045
Del Monte 2001676
Sunfield 703107
Our House OHPS610

1,904 Sysco Memphis 
LLC 2001676 Delmonte - 4563383 NET30 6/10# $56.80 $108,147.20 3-weeks

1168 CASE

**Pears, Slices, Canned - Packed to U.S. Grade B 
standard or better, 6/#10 cans per case, Bartlett, 
packed in 100% juice. Minimum Drained Weight: 65 
oz.  

Ship Lot: 952 

Our House OHPRS610
DEL MONTE 2004499

3,808 CHURCHFIELD 
TRADING OHPRS610 OUR HOUSE  

OHPRS610 NET 30 6/ #10 $40.32 $153,538.56 14 DAYS AWARD

2025-2026 SY Can-Pouch Bid I 



Memphis Shelby County Schools (MSCS) 
Division of Nutrition Services

2025 - 2026 1st Semester Canned and Pouch Bid
July 31, 2025 - December 12, 2025

1
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A B C D E F G H I J K L M N O

Stock 
Number Unit Description                                                            Approved Brands

(Manufacture Product Code)
  2025-2026 SY Estimated Cases

July 31, 2025 - December 12, 2025       
Bidder

 
Manufacturer's 

Product
Code

Bidder's
Brand & Product Code

Bidder's
Terms Pack Size Cost            

per Case
Extended Total          

Cost
Lead Time Comments AWARDS

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 Column 5 Column 6 Column 7 Column 8 Column 9 Column 10 Column 11 Column 12 Column 13 Column 14 Column 15

Bid Submissions That Deviate From What Is Being 
Requested In The Specifications Below Will Be 

Considered A Non Acceptable Vendor Response.

** Indicates available USDA commodity may 
impact actual usage quantities. 

DELIVERIES BEGIN 07/31/2025 THRU 
12/12/2025 

FALL BREAK OCTOBER 13-17 - NO 
DELIVERIES THIS WEEK

THANKSGIVING BREAK NOVEMBER 24-28 - 
NO DELIVERIES THIS WEEK 

CHRISTMAS BREAK DECEMBER 22, 2025- 
JANUARY 5, 2026

Pack Sizes listed in the specs are 
reflective of the current awarded 

brand, all pack sizes will be thoroughly 
evaluated for approval. 

Items listed are Pre-Approved 
Brands. MSCS will accept an 

item: (1) as long as it meets the 
bid specification and (2) tested 
and approved through MSCS's 

Sample Submission Process.

ALL SHIP 
LOTS ARE IN 

CASES.

19

20

21

22

23

1168 CASE

**Pears, Slices, Canned - Packed to U.S. Grade B 
standard or better, 6/#10 cans per case, Bartlett, 
packed in 100% juice. Minimum Drained Weight: 65 
oz.  

Ship Lot: 952 

Our House OHPRS610
DEL MONTE 2004499

3,808 Robbins Sales 
Co. Inc. 19211-56712 Port Royal Premium 

19211-56712 Net 30 6/#10 $38.48 $146,531.84 21 Days

SAMPLE SENT 
SAMPLE FAILED 

BECAUSE SAMPLE WAS 
NOT SLICED  

DOES NOT MEET SPEC, 
MORE QUARTERS 

THAN SLICES

1168 CASE

**Pears, Slices, Canned - Packed to U.S. Grade B 
standard or better, 6/#10 cans per case, Bartlett, 
packed in 100% juice. Minimum Drained Weight: 65 
oz.  

Ship Lot: 952 

Our House OHPRS610
DEL MONTE 2004499

3,808
Schreiber Foods 

International, 
Inc

38515 Ambrosia net 30 days 6/#10 $37.30 $142,038.40 7-10 days NO SAMPLE SENT 

1170 CASE

Pineapple Chunks, Canned - Packed to U.S. Grade A 
standard, 6/#10 cans per case, packed in pineapple 
juice.  Minimum Drained Weight: 66 oz. 

Ship Lot:  952 

Sunfield 1170/703070
Dole 00468
Port Royal Premium 19211-57710
GFS Limson Trading Co. 114511
Del Monte 2001715                                
Our House OHP610                                        
Stella 79543 00031
Ambrosia 19063

2856 CHURCHFIELD 
TRADING OHP610 OUR HOUSE OHP610 NET 30 6/ #10 $35.27 $100,731.12 14 DAYS BIDDING TIDBITS DOES NOT MEET 

SPEC

1170 CASE

Pineapple Chunks, Canned - Packed to U.S. Grade A 
standard, 6/#10 cans per case, packed in pineapple 
juice.  Minimum Drained Weight: 66 oz. 

Ship Lot:  952 

Sunfield 1170/703070
Dole 00468
Port Royal Premium 19211-57710
GFS Limson Trading Co. 114511
Del Monte 2001715                                
Our House OHP610                                        
Stella 79543 00031
Ambrosia 19063

2856 Robbins Sales 
Co. Inc. 19211-57710 Port Royal Premium 

19211-57710 Net 30 6/#10 $35.90 $102,530.40 21 Days AWARD

2025-2026 SY Can-Pouch Bid I 



Memphis Shelby County Schools (MSCS) 
Division of Nutrition Services

2025 - 2026 1st Semester Canned and Pouch Bid
July 31, 2025 - December 12, 2025

1
2

3

A B C D E F G H I J K L M N O

Stock 
Number Unit Description                                                            Approved Brands

(Manufacture Product Code)
  2025-2026 SY Estimated Cases

July 31, 2025 - December 12, 2025       
Bidder

 
Manufacturer's 

Product
Code

Bidder's
Brand & Product Code

Bidder's
Terms Pack Size Cost            

per Case
Extended Total          

Cost
Lead Time Comments AWARDS

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 Column 5 Column 6 Column 7 Column 8 Column 9 Column 10 Column 11 Column 12 Column 13 Column 14 Column 15

Bid Submissions That Deviate From What Is Being 
Requested In The Specifications Below Will Be 

Considered A Non Acceptable Vendor Response.

** Indicates available USDA commodity may 
impact actual usage quantities. 

DELIVERIES BEGIN 07/31/2025 THRU 
12/12/2025 

FALL BREAK OCTOBER 13-17 - NO 
DELIVERIES THIS WEEK

THANKSGIVING BREAK NOVEMBER 24-28 - 
NO DELIVERIES THIS WEEK 

CHRISTMAS BREAK DECEMBER 22, 2025- 
JANUARY 5, 2026

Pack Sizes listed in the specs are 
reflective of the current awarded 

brand, all pack sizes will be thoroughly 
evaluated for approval. 

Items listed are Pre-Approved 
Brands. MSCS will accept an 

item: (1) as long as it meets the 
bid specification and (2) tested 
and approved through MSCS's 

Sample Submission Process.

ALL SHIP 
LOTS ARE IN 

CASES.

24

25

26

27

28

29

1170 CASE

Pineapple Chunks, Canned - Packed to U.S. Grade A 
standard, 6/#10 cans per case, packed in pineapple 
juice.  Minimum Drained Weight: 66 oz. 

Ship Lot:  952 

Sunfield 1170/703070
Dole 00468
Port Royal Premium 19211-57710
GFS Limson Trading Co. 114511
Del Monte 2001715                                
Our House OHP610                                        
Stella 79543 00031
Ambrosia 19063

2856
Schreiber Foods 

International, 
Inc

19063 Ambrosia net 30 days 6/#10 $44.75 $127,806.00 7-10 days

1183 CASE

Greens, Turnip - Packed to U.S. GRADE A standards, 
must be low sodium.   Cut, minimum drained wt. 60 
oz. Six cans per case.                                                                                        

Ship Lot: 476

Allen 21213
Margaret Holmes 11252                        
McCall 5TGBBB
McCall 21213
McCall 5616842 1,904 CHURCHFIELD 

TRADING 5TGBBB MCCALL 5TGBBB NET 30 6/ #10 $44.24 $84,232.96 14 DAYS

1183 CASE

Greens, Turnip - Packed to U.S. GRADE A standards, 
must be low sodium.   Cut, minimum drained wt. 60 
oz. Six cans per case.                                                                                        

Ship Lot: 476

Allen 21213
Margaret Holmes 11252                        
McCall 5TGBBB
McCall 21213
McCall 5616842 1,904 Robbins Sales 

Co. Inc. 11252 Margaret Holmes Net 30 6/#10 $34.44 $65,573.76 21 Days AWARD

1183 CASE

Greens, Turnip - Packed to U.S. GRADE A standards, 
must be low sodium.   Cut, minimum drained wt. 60 
oz. Six cans per case.                                                                                        

Ship Lot: 476

Allen 21213
Margaret Holmes 11252                        
McCall 5TGBBB
McCall 21213
McCall 5616842 1,904 Sysco Memphis 

LLC 21213 Allens - 5616842 NET30 6/10# $35.05 $66,735.20 2-weeks

2025-2026 SY Can-Pouch Bid I 



Memphis Shelby County Schools (MSCS) 
Division of Nutrition Services

2025 - 2026 1st Semester Canned and Pouch Bid
July 31, 2025 - December 12, 2025

1
2

3

A B C D E F G H I J K L M N O

Stock 
Number Unit Description                                                            Approved Brands

(Manufacture Product Code)
  2025-2026 SY Estimated Cases

July 31, 2025 - December 12, 2025       
Bidder

 
Manufacturer's 

Product
Code

Bidder's
Brand & Product Code

Bidder's
Terms Pack Size Cost            

per Case
Extended Total          

Cost
Lead Time Comments AWARDS

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 Column 5 Column 6 Column 7 Column 8 Column 9 Column 10 Column 11 Column 12 Column 13 Column 14 Column 15

Bid Submissions That Deviate From What Is Being 
Requested In The Specifications Below Will Be 

Considered A Non Acceptable Vendor Response.

** Indicates available USDA commodity may 
impact actual usage quantities. 

DELIVERIES BEGIN 07/31/2025 THRU 
12/12/2025 

FALL BREAK OCTOBER 13-17 - NO 
DELIVERIES THIS WEEK

THANKSGIVING BREAK NOVEMBER 24-28 - 
NO DELIVERIES THIS WEEK 

CHRISTMAS BREAK DECEMBER 22, 2025- 
JANUARY 5, 2026

Pack Sizes listed in the specs are 
reflective of the current awarded 

brand, all pack sizes will be thoroughly 
evaluated for approval. 

Items listed are Pre-Approved 
Brands. MSCS will accept an 

item: (1) as long as it meets the 
bid specification and (2) tested 
and approved through MSCS's 

Sample Submission Process.

ALL SHIP 
LOTS ARE IN 

CASES.

30

31

32

33

34

35

1200 CASE

Manadarin Oranges, Canned - Mandarin Orange Fruit 
canned - Shelf Stable. Packed in 100% fruit juice. Each 
cup to meet 1/2 cup fruit serving for the Child 
Nutrition Program. Approximately packed 6 cans per 
case. Please indicate if packed differently. 

Ship Lot:  952  

Port Royal Premium 6-19211-55020-6

2,856 CHURCHFIELD 
TRADING GAMO610 GREEN ACRES 

GAMO610 NET 30 6/ #10 $41.20 $117,667.20 14 DAYS SAMPLE SENT 
SAMPLE FAILED 

1200 CASE

Manadarin Oranges, Canned - Mandarin Orange Fruit 
canned - Shelf Stable. Packed in 100% fruit juice. Each 
cup to meet 1/2 cup fruit serving for the Child 
Nutrition Program. Approximately packed 6 cans per 
case. Please indicate if packed differently. 

Ship Lot:  952  

Port Royal Premium 6-19211-55020-6

2,856 Robbins Sales 
Co. Inc. 6-19211-55020-6 Port Royal Premium 6-

19211-55020-6 Net 30 6/#10 $43.90 $125,378.40 21 Days AWARD

1223 CASE

Pepperoncini Slices - Bright green pickled 
pepperoncini slices. Packed in a case with 4/1 gallon 
resealable plastic jars per case.

Ship Lot:  200

Ambrosia 25219

600
Schreiber Foods 

International, 
Inc

25219 Ambrosia net 30 days 6/#10 $30.70 $18,420.00 7-10 days AWARD

1234 CASE

Jalapeno Peppers, Sliced - . Packed in 1 gallon plastic 
resealable jar or in cans. Each case to contain 4/1 
gallon plastic jars or 6/#10 Cans per case.  Minimum 
Drained Weight: 80 oz.  If packed differently, please 
indicate. 

Ship Lot: 100

Schreiber/Ambrosia 17458
Ourhouse OHJP610-NEW

800 CHURCHFIELD 
TRADING OHJP610 OHJP610 NET 30 6/ #10 $23.69 $18,952.00 14 DAYS AWARD

2025-2026 SY Can-Pouch Bid I 



Memphis Shelby County Schools (MSCS) 
Division of Nutrition Services

2025 - 2026 1st Semester Canned and Pouch Bid
July 31, 2025 - December 12, 2025

1
2

3

A B C D E F G H I J K L M N O

Stock 
Number Unit Description                                                            Approved Brands

(Manufacture Product Code)
  2025-2026 SY Estimated Cases

July 31, 2025 - December 12, 2025       
Bidder

 
Manufacturer's 

Product
Code

Bidder's
Brand & Product Code

Bidder's
Terms Pack Size Cost            

per Case
Extended Total          

Cost
Lead Time Comments AWARDS

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 Column 5 Column 6 Column 7 Column 8 Column 9 Column 10 Column 11 Column 12 Column 13 Column 14 Column 15

Bid Submissions That Deviate From What Is Being 
Requested In The Specifications Below Will Be 

Considered A Non Acceptable Vendor Response.

** Indicates available USDA commodity may 
impact actual usage quantities. 

DELIVERIES BEGIN 07/31/2025 THRU 
12/12/2025 

FALL BREAK OCTOBER 13-17 - NO 
DELIVERIES THIS WEEK

THANKSGIVING BREAK NOVEMBER 24-28 - 
NO DELIVERIES THIS WEEK 

CHRISTMAS BREAK DECEMBER 22, 2025- 
JANUARY 5, 2026

Pack Sizes listed in the specs are 
reflective of the current awarded 

brand, all pack sizes will be thoroughly 
evaluated for approval. 

Items listed are Pre-Approved 
Brands. MSCS will accept an 

item: (1) as long as it meets the 
bid specification and (2) tested 
and approved through MSCS's 

Sample Submission Process.

ALL SHIP 
LOTS ARE IN 

CASES.

36

37

38

39

40

1234 CASE

Jalapeno Peppers, Sliced - . Packed in 1 gallon plastic 
resealable jar or in cans. Each case to contain 4/1 
gallon plastic jars or 6/#10 Cans per case.  Minimum 
Drained Weight: 80 oz.  If packed differently, please 
indicate. 

Ship Lot: 100

Schreiber/Ambrosia 17458
Ourhouse OHJP610-NEW

800
Schreiber Foods 

International, 
Inc

17458 Ambrosia net 30 days 4/1 gal $23.85 $19,080.00 7-10 days

1282 CASE

Salsa/Picante Sauce  - A blend of tomatoes, onion, 
peppers and spices in a tomato sauce.  Mild in spice.
Approximate Pack: 4/1 gallon resealable jugs per case.  

       
Ship Lot: 400 

Rosarita 44300-10677
Pace 489239
Casa Solana 485-4952-0211
Del Pasado 273275
Rosarita 44300-10688 2,000 Conagra Brands, 

Inc. 44300-10688 Rosarita 44300-10677 Net 30 Days 6/#10 $59.00 $118,000.00 4 Weeks

1282 CASE

Salsa/Picante Sauce  - A blend of tomatoes, onion, 
peppers and spices in a tomato sauce.  Mild in spice.
Approximate Pack: 4/1 gallon resealable jugs per case.  

       
Ship Lot: 400 

Rosarita 44300-10677
Pace 489239
Casa Solana 485-4952-0211
Del Pasado 273275
Rosarita 44300-10688 2,000 Sysco Memphis 

LLC 200650000067_ Pace - 4006482 NET30 4/138oz $50.18 $100,360.00 2-weeks
Pace 489239 is not a good code per 
Marilyn Lernor at Core. Please see 

note in flashdrive.

AWARD

PACE PRODUCT 
CODE CHANGED

2025-2026 SY Can-Pouch Bid I 



Memphis Shelby County Schools (MSCS) 
Division of Nutrition Services

2025 - 2026 1st Semester Canned and Pouch Bid
July 31, 2025 - December 12, 2025

1
2

3

A B C D E F G H I J K L M N O

Stock 
Number Unit Description                                                            Approved Brands

(Manufacture Product Code)
  2025-2026 SY Estimated Cases

July 31, 2025 - December 12, 2025       
Bidder

 
Manufacturer's 

Product
Code

Bidder's
Brand & Product Code

Bidder's
Terms Pack Size Cost            

per Case
Extended Total          

Cost
Lead Time Comments AWARDS

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 Column 5 Column 6 Column 7 Column 8 Column 9 Column 10 Column 11 Column 12 Column 13 Column 14 Column 15

Bid Submissions That Deviate From What Is Being 
Requested In The Specifications Below Will Be 

Considered A Non Acceptable Vendor Response.

** Indicates available USDA commodity may 
impact actual usage quantities. 

DELIVERIES BEGIN 07/31/2025 THRU 
12/12/2025 

FALL BREAK OCTOBER 13-17 - NO 
DELIVERIES THIS WEEK

THANKSGIVING BREAK NOVEMBER 24-28 - 
NO DELIVERIES THIS WEEK 

CHRISTMAS BREAK DECEMBER 22, 2025- 
JANUARY 5, 2026

Pack Sizes listed in the specs are 
reflective of the current awarded 

brand, all pack sizes will be thoroughly 
evaluated for approval. 

Items listed are Pre-Approved 
Brands. MSCS will accept an 

item: (1) as long as it meets the 
bid specification and (2) tested 
and approved through MSCS's 

Sample Submission Process.

ALL SHIP 
LOTS ARE IN 

CASES.

41

42

43

1287 CASE

Sauce, Barbecue, Ready to Use -  A blend of spices 
with smoked BBQ flavor.  Reddish-Brown in color.
Approximate Pack: 4/1-Gallon/Case.  

Ship Lot: 300

Old West 025
Cattleman's 05309-4
Marzetti's 83030
Ken's KE0784
Ken's KEO849
CF Sauer 06187
Monarch 919085

1,200 Red Gold REDOA5P REDOA5P Net 30 4 / 1 Gallon 
Bottle $49.32 $59,184.00

10 
Business 

Days

Price provided is for Half 
Truckload, 13 pallets/20,000 

pounds.  Truck can be a mix of 
awarded products shipped in full 

pallet quantity. Direct ship to 
Shelby County Central 

Warehouse.

1287 CASE

Sauce, Barbecue, Ready to Use -  A blend of spices 
with smoked BBQ flavor.  Reddish-Brown in color.
Approximate Pack: 4/1-Gallon/Case.  

Ship Lot: 300

Old West 025
Cattleman's 05309-4
Marzetti's 83030
Ken's KE0784
Ken's KEO849
CF Sauer 06187
Monarch 919085

1,200 CHURCHFIELD 
TRADING 0 25 OLD WEST 025 NET 30 6/ #10 $44.65 $53,580.00 21 DAYS

1287 CASE

Sauce, Barbecue, Ready to Use -  A blend of spices 
with smoked BBQ flavor.  Reddish-Brown in color.
Approximate Pack: 4/1-Gallon/Case.  

Ship Lot: 300

Old West 025
Cattleman's 05309-4
Marzetti's 83030
Ken's KE0784
Ken's KEO849
CF Sauer 06187
Monarch 919085

1,200 Sysco Memphis 
LLC 053094 Cattlemans - 4005559 NET30 4/1GAL $52.59 $63,108.00 2-weeks

2025-2026 SY Can-Pouch Bid I 



Memphis Shelby County Schools (MSCS) 
Division of Nutrition Services

2025 - 2026 1st Semester Canned and Pouch Bid
July 31, 2025 - December 12, 2025

1
2

3

A B C D E F G H I J K L M N O

Stock 
Number Unit Description                                                            Approved Brands

(Manufacture Product Code)
  2025-2026 SY Estimated Cases

July 31, 2025 - December 12, 2025       
Bidder

 
Manufacturer's 

Product
Code

Bidder's
Brand & Product Code

Bidder's
Terms Pack Size Cost            

per Case
Extended Total          

Cost
Lead Time Comments AWARDS

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 Column 5 Column 6 Column 7 Column 8 Column 9 Column 10 Column 11 Column 12 Column 13 Column 14 Column 15

Bid Submissions That Deviate From What Is Being 
Requested In The Specifications Below Will Be 

Considered A Non Acceptable Vendor Response.

** Indicates available USDA commodity may 
impact actual usage quantities. 

DELIVERIES BEGIN 07/31/2025 THRU 
12/12/2025 

FALL BREAK OCTOBER 13-17 - NO 
DELIVERIES THIS WEEK

THANKSGIVING BREAK NOVEMBER 24-28 - 
NO DELIVERIES THIS WEEK 

CHRISTMAS BREAK DECEMBER 22, 2025- 
JANUARY 5, 2026

Pack Sizes listed in the specs are 
reflective of the current awarded 

brand, all pack sizes will be thoroughly 
evaluated for approval. 

Items listed are Pre-Approved 
Brands. MSCS will accept an 

item: (1) as long as it meets the 
bid specification and (2) tested 
and approved through MSCS's 

Sample Submission Process.

ALL SHIP 
LOTS ARE IN 

CASES.

44

45

46

47

48

49

1287 CASE

Sauce, Barbecue, Ready to Use -  A blend of spices 
with smoked BBQ flavor.  Reddish-Brown in color.
Approximate Pack: 4/1-Gallon/Case.  

Ship Lot: 300

Old West 025
Cattleman's 05309-4
Marzetti's 83030
Ken's KE0784
Ken's KEO849
CF Sauer 06187
Monarch 919085

1,200 Marzetti 83030 Marzetti 83030 2/10 Net 30 4 $39.90 $47,880.00 5 Business 
Days

AWARD

1295 CASE

Cranberry Sauce, Jellied, Canned.  Packed to U.S. 
Grade A standard, 6/#10 Cans per case.  

Ship Lot: 200 

Oregon Trail 4171261000
Clement 232079
GFS/Clement 0100610
Ocean Spray 01400
Sysco Imperial 5729967

200 Sysco Memphis 
LLC 01400 Ocean Spray - 4015889 NET30 6/10# $62.87 $12,574.00 3-weeks

AWARD

1305 CASE

Tomato Sauce, Canned  - Packed to U.S. Grade A 
standards. Rich tomato sauce with smooth 
consistency. Approximate Can Size: 115 oz., or  #10 
can equivalent.

Ship Lot: 250 Cases

Hunts 39057
Port Royal Premium 463880

500 Red Gold RPKHA99 RPKHA99 Net 30 6 / #10 Can $29.45 $14,725.00
10 

Business 
Days

Price provided is for Half 
Truckload, 13 pallets/20,000 

pounds.  Truck can be a mix of 
awarded products shipped in full 

pallet quantity. Direct ship to 
Shelby County Central 

Warehouse.

SAMPLE SENT SAMPLE 
PASSED 

ADD AS APPROVED 
BRAND

1305 CASE

Tomato Sauce, Canned  - Packed to U.S. Grade A 
standards. Rich tomato sauce with smooth 
consistency. Approximate Can Size: 115 oz., or  #10 
can equivalent.

Ship Lot: 250 Cases

Hunts 39057
Port Royal Premium 463880

500 Conagra Brands, 
Inc. 27000-39061 Hunts 27000-39061 Net 30 Days 6/105 OZ $30.00 $15,000.00 4 Weeks

2025-2026 SY Can-Pouch Bid I 



Memphis Shelby County Schools (MSCS) 
Division of Nutrition Services

2025 - 2026 1st Semester Canned and Pouch Bid
July 31, 2025 - December 12, 2025

1
2

3

A B C D E F G H I J K L M N O

Stock 
Number Unit Description                                                            Approved Brands

(Manufacture Product Code)
  2025-2026 SY Estimated Cases

July 31, 2025 - December 12, 2025       
Bidder

 
Manufacturer's 

Product
Code

Bidder's
Brand & Product Code

Bidder's
Terms Pack Size Cost            

per Case
Extended Total          

Cost
Lead Time Comments AWARDS

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 Column 5 Column 6 Column 7 Column 8 Column 9 Column 10 Column 11 Column 12 Column 13 Column 14 Column 15

Bid Submissions That Deviate From What Is Being 
Requested In The Specifications Below Will Be 

Considered A Non Acceptable Vendor Response.

** Indicates available USDA commodity may 
impact actual usage quantities. 

DELIVERIES BEGIN 07/31/2025 THRU 
12/12/2025 

FALL BREAK OCTOBER 13-17 - NO 
DELIVERIES THIS WEEK

THANKSGIVING BREAK NOVEMBER 24-28 - 
NO DELIVERIES THIS WEEK 

CHRISTMAS BREAK DECEMBER 22, 2025- 
JANUARY 5, 2026

Pack Sizes listed in the specs are 
reflective of the current awarded 

brand, all pack sizes will be thoroughly 
evaluated for approval. 

Items listed are Pre-Approved 
Brands. MSCS will accept an 

item: (1) as long as it meets the 
bid specification and (2) tested 
and approved through MSCS's 

Sample Submission Process.

ALL SHIP 
LOTS ARE IN 

CASES.

50

51

52

53

1305 CASE

Tomato Sauce, Canned  - Packed to U.S. Grade A 
standards. Rich tomato sauce with smooth 
consistency. Approximate Can Size: 115 oz., or  #10 
can equivalent.

Ship Lot: 250 Cases

Hunts 39057
Port Royal Premium 463880

500 CHURCHFIELD 
TRADING OHTS610 OHTS610 NET 30 6/ #10 $20.85 $10,425.00 14 DAYS

AWARD

SAMPLE SENT 
SAMPLE PASSED 

ADD AS 
APPROVED BRAND

1305 CASE

Tomato Sauce, Canned  - Packed to U.S. Grade A 
standards. Rich tomato sauce with smooth 
consistency. Approximate Can Size: 115 oz., or  #10 
can equivalent.

Ship Lot: 250 Cases

Hunts 39057
Port Royal Premium 463880

500 Robbins Sales 
Co. Inc. 463880 Port Royal Premium 

463880 Net 30 6/#10 $31.44 $15,720.00 21 Days

1305 CASE

Tomato Sauce, Canned  - Packed to U.S. Grade A 
standards. Rich tomato sauce with smooth 
consistency. Approximate Can Size: 115 oz., or  #10 
can equivalent.

Ship Lot: 250 Cases

Hunts 39057
Port Royal Premium 463880

500 Sysco Memphis 
LLC 2700039061 Hunts - 4030268 NET30 6/10# $33.33 $16,665.00 2-weeks

Hunts 39057 is not a vaild code, Emily 
Papineau informed via email 5/15. See 

note in flash drive.
CHANGE PRODUCT CODE 

2025-2026 SY Can-Pouch Bid I 



Memphis Shelby County Schools (MSCS) 
Division of Nutrition Services

2025 - 2026 1st Semester Canned and Pouch Bid
July 31, 2025 - December 12, 2025

1
2

3

A B C D E F G H I J K L M N O

Stock 
Number Unit Description                                                            Approved Brands

(Manufacture Product Code)
  2025-2026 SY Estimated Cases

July 31, 2025 - December 12, 2025       
Bidder

 
Manufacturer's 

Product
Code

Bidder's
Brand & Product Code

Bidder's
Terms Pack Size Cost            

per Case
Extended Total          

Cost
Lead Time Comments AWARDS

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 Column 5 Column 6 Column 7 Column 8 Column 9 Column 10 Column 11 Column 12 Column 13 Column 14 Column 15

Bid Submissions That Deviate From What Is Being 
Requested In The Specifications Below Will Be 

Considered A Non Acceptable Vendor Response.

** Indicates available USDA commodity may 
impact actual usage quantities. 

DELIVERIES BEGIN 07/31/2025 THRU 
12/12/2025 

FALL BREAK OCTOBER 13-17 - NO 
DELIVERIES THIS WEEK

THANKSGIVING BREAK NOVEMBER 24-28 - 
NO DELIVERIES THIS WEEK 

CHRISTMAS BREAK DECEMBER 22, 2025- 
JANUARY 5, 2026

Pack Sizes listed in the specs are 
reflective of the current awarded 

brand, all pack sizes will be thoroughly 
evaluated for approval. 

Items listed are Pre-Approved 
Brands. MSCS will accept an 

item: (1) as long as it meets the 
bid specification and (2) tested 
and approved through MSCS's 

Sample Submission Process.

ALL SHIP 
LOTS ARE IN 

CASES.

54

55

56

1443 CASE

Whole Kernel Corn, Canned - Golden Yellow. Low 
Sodium (below 140mg), Packed to U.S. Grade B 
standards or better, 6/#10 cans/case. Minimum 
drained weight 68 oz. per can. 

Ship Lot: 952

Lakeside 7054
Allen/Happy Chef 70213                       
Allens 70217
Margaret Holmes 5COBBB
Del Monte 2004499
Our House OHWKC610 
Ambrosia 26011                                      
ChurchField NPC610
Port Royal Premium 19211-66207

2,856 CHURCHFIELD 
TRADING OHWKC610 OUR HOUSE 

OHWKC610
NET 30 6/ #10 $26.52 $75,741.12 14 DAYS

1443 CASE

Whole Kernel Corn, Canned - Golden Yellow. Low 
Sodium (below 140mg), Packed to U.S. Grade B 
standards or better, 6/#10 cans/case. Minimum 
drained weight 68 oz. per can. 

Ship Lot: 952

Lakeside 7054
Allen/Happy Chef 70213                       
Allens 70217
Margaret Holmes 5COBBB
Del Monte 2004499
Our House OHWKC610 
Ambrosia 26011                                      
ChurchField NPC610
Port Royal Premium 19211-66207

2,856 Robbins Sales 
Co. Inc. 19211-66207 Port Royal Premium 

19211-66207
Net 30 6/#10 $24.98 $71,342.88 21 Days

AWARD

1443 CASE

Whole Kernel Corn, Canned - Golden Yellow. Low 
Sodium (below 140mg), Packed to U.S. Grade B 
standards or better, 6/#10 cans/case. Minimum 
drained weight 68 oz. per can. 

Ship Lot: 952

Lakeside 7054
Allen/Happy Chef 70213                       
Allens 70217
Margaret Holmes 5COBBB
Del Monte 2004499
Our House OHWKC610 
Ambrosia 26011                                      
ChurchField NPC610
Port Royal Premium 19211-66207

2,856
Schreiber Foods 

International, 
Inc

26011 Ambrosia net 30 days 6/#10 $30.55 $87,250.80 7-10 days

2025-2026 SY Can-Pouch Bid I 



Memphis Shelby County Schools (MSCS) 
Division of Nutrition Services

2025 - 2026 1st Semester Canned and Pouch Bid
July 31, 2025 - December 12, 2025

1
2

3

A B C D E F G H I J K L M N O

Stock 
Number Unit Description                                                            Approved Brands

(Manufacture Product Code)
  2025-2026 SY Estimated Cases

July 31, 2025 - December 12, 2025       
Bidder

 
Manufacturer's 

Product
Code

Bidder's
Brand & Product Code

Bidder's
Terms Pack Size Cost            

per Case
Extended Total          

Cost
Lead Time Comments AWARDS

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 Column 5 Column 6 Column 7 Column 8 Column 9 Column 10 Column 11 Column 12 Column 13 Column 14 Column 15

Bid Submissions That Deviate From What Is Being 
Requested In The Specifications Below Will Be 

Considered A Non Acceptable Vendor Response.

** Indicates available USDA commodity may 
impact actual usage quantities. 

DELIVERIES BEGIN 07/31/2025 THRU 
12/12/2025 

FALL BREAK OCTOBER 13-17 - NO 
DELIVERIES THIS WEEK

THANKSGIVING BREAK NOVEMBER 24-28 - 
NO DELIVERIES THIS WEEK 

CHRISTMAS BREAK DECEMBER 22, 2025- 
JANUARY 5, 2026

Pack Sizes listed in the specs are 
reflective of the current awarded 

brand, all pack sizes will be thoroughly 
evaluated for approval. 

Items listed are Pre-Approved 
Brands. MSCS will accept an 

item: (1) as long as it meets the 
bid specification and (2) tested 
and approved through MSCS's 

Sample Submission Process.

ALL SHIP 
LOTS ARE IN 

CASES.

57

58

59

60

61

1443 CASE

Whole Kernel Corn, Canned - Golden Yellow. Low 
Sodium (below 140mg), Packed to U.S. Grade B 
standards or better, 6/#10 cans/case. Minimum 
drained weight 68 oz. per can. 

Ship Lot: 952

Lakeside 7054
Allen/Happy Chef 70213                       
Allens 70217
Margaret Holmes 5COBBB
Del Monte 2004499
Our House OHWKC610 
Ambrosia 26011                                      
ChurchField NPC610
Port Royal Premium 19211-66207

2,856 Sysco Memphis 
LLC 2004499 Delmonte - 7025892 NET30 6/10# $38.39 $109,641.84 3-weeks

1475 CASE

Sweet Potatoes, Canned - Fancy Cut packed in light 
syrup.  Sliced approx. 1 1/2"-2 1/2" across  and 3/4" to 
1 1/4" thick. Packed to U.S. Grade A standard, 6 #10 
cans/case.  Minimum Drained Weight: 73 oz. 

Ship Lot: 476

Bruce 04441 (5YCTELSBB)
Allen's Princella 08213
GFS/Moody Dunbar 796325

1,904 CHURCHFIELD 
TRADING OHSP610 OUR HOUSE  

OHSP610
NET 30 6/ #10 $37.85 $72,066.40 14 DAYS

1475 CASE

Sweet Potatoes, Canned - Fancy Cut packed in light 
syrup.  Sliced approx. 1 1/2"-2 1/2" across  and 3/4" to 
1 1/4" thick. Packed to U.S. Grade A standard, 6 #10 
cans/case.  Minimum Drained Weight: 73 oz. 

Ship Lot: 476

Bruce 04441 (5YCTELSBB)
Allen's Princella 08213
GFS/Moody Dunbar 796325

1,904 Robbins Sales 
Co. Inc. 19211-66046 Golden Harvest 19211-

66046 Net 30 6/#10 $33.44 $63,669.76 21 Days

AWARD

SAMPLE SENT 
SAMPLE PASSED

1475 CASE

Sweet Potatoes, Canned - Fancy Cut packed in light 
syrup.  Sliced approx. 1 1/2"-2 1/2" across  and 3/4" to 
1 1/4" thick. Packed to U.S. Grade A standard, 6 #10 
cans/case.  Minimum Drained Weight: 73 oz. 

Ship Lot: 476

Bruce 04441 (5YCTELSBB)
Allen's Princella 08213
GFS/Moody Dunbar 796325

1,904
Schreiber Foods 

International, 
Inc

13140 Ambrosia net 30 days 6/#10 $33.00 $62,832.00 7-10 days NO SAMPLE SENT 

2025-2026 SY Can-Pouch Bid I 



Memphis Shelby County Schools (MSCS) 
Division of Nutrition Services

2025 - 2026 1st Semester Canned and Pouch Bid
July 31, 2025 - December 12, 2025

1
2

3

A B C D E F G H I J K L M N O

Stock 
Number Unit Description                                                            Approved Brands

(Manufacture Product Code)
  2025-2026 SY Estimated Cases

July 31, 2025 - December 12, 2025       
Bidder

 
Manufacturer's 

Product
Code

Bidder's
Brand & Product Code

Bidder's
Terms Pack Size Cost            

per Case
Extended Total          

Cost
Lead Time Comments AWARDS

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 Column 5 Column 6 Column 7 Column 8 Column 9 Column 10 Column 11 Column 12 Column 13 Column 14 Column 15

Bid Submissions That Deviate From What Is Being 
Requested In The Specifications Below Will Be 

Considered A Non Acceptable Vendor Response.

** Indicates available USDA commodity may 
impact actual usage quantities. 

DELIVERIES BEGIN 07/31/2025 THRU 
12/12/2025 

FALL BREAK OCTOBER 13-17 - NO 
DELIVERIES THIS WEEK

THANKSGIVING BREAK NOVEMBER 24-28 - 
NO DELIVERIES THIS WEEK 

CHRISTMAS BREAK DECEMBER 22, 2025- 
JANUARY 5, 2026

Pack Sizes listed in the specs are 
reflective of the current awarded 

brand, all pack sizes will be thoroughly 
evaluated for approval. 

Items listed are Pre-Approved 
Brands. MSCS will accept an 

item: (1) as long as it meets the 
bid specification and (2) tested 
and approved through MSCS's 

Sample Submission Process.

ALL SHIP 
LOTS ARE IN 

CASES.

62

63

64

65

66

1475 CASE

Sweet Potatoes, Canned - Fancy Cut packed in light 
syrup.  Sliced approx. 1 1/2"-2 1/2" across  and 3/4" to 
1 1/4" thick. Packed to U.S. Grade A standard, 6 #10 
cans/case.  Minimum Drained Weight: 73 oz. 

Ship Lot: 476

Bruce 04441 (5YCTELSBB)
Allen's Princella 08213
GFS/Moody Dunbar 796325

1,904 Sysco Memphis 
LLC 04441 Bruce - 4119046 - New item NET30 6/10# $36.92 $70,295.68 5-weeks

1491 CASE

Tomatoes, Diced, No Added Salt, - Canned , packed to 
U.S. grade B standards or better. Packed: 6/#10 
cans/case.  Must have 140mg of sodium or less per 
serving.  

Ship Lot: 250

Angela Mia 38067
Red Gold REDBQ9B                                 
Furmano F11390                                     
Red Gold REDBQ9B

500 Red Gold REDBQ9B REDBQ9B Net 30 6 / #10 can $28.02 $14,010.00
10 

Business 
Days

Price provided is for Half 
Truckload, 13 pallets/20,000 

pounds.  Truck can be a mix of 
awarded products shipped in full 

pallet quantity. Direct ship to 
Shelby County Central 

Warehouse.

1491 CASE

Tomatoes, Diced, No Added Salt, - Canned , packed to 
U.S. grade B standards or better. Packed: 6/#10 
cans/case.  Must have 140mg of sodium or less per 
serving.  

Ship Lot: 250

Angela Mia 38067
Red Gold REDBQ9B                                 
Furmano F11390                                     
Red Gold REDBQ9B

500 Conagra Brands, 
Inc. 27000-38067 Angela Mia 27000-

38067
Net 30 Days 6/102.5 OZ $24.70 $12,350.00 2 Weeks

1491 CASE

Tomatoes, Diced, No Added Salt, - Canned , packed to 
U.S. grade B standards or better. Packed: 6/#10 
cans/case.  Must have 140mg of sodium or less per 
serving.  

Ship Lot: 250

Angela Mia 38067
Red Gold REDBQ9B                                 
Furmano F11390                                     
Red Gold REDBQ9B

500 CHURCHFIELD 
TRADING OHDT610  OUR HOUSE  

OHDT610
NET 30 6/ #10 $23.94 $11,970.00 14 DAYS

AWARD

SAMPLE SENT 
SAMPLE PASSED 

ADD AS APPROVED 
BRAND

2025-2026 SY Can-Pouch Bid I 



Memphis Shelby County Schools (MSCS) 
Division of Nutrition Services

2025 - 2026 1st Semester Canned and Pouch Bid
July 31, 2025 - December 12, 2025

1
2

3

A B C D E F G H I J K L M N O

Stock 
Number Unit Description                                                            Approved Brands

(Manufacture Product Code)
  2025-2026 SY Estimated Cases

July 31, 2025 - December 12, 2025       
Bidder

 
Manufacturer's 

Product
Code

Bidder's
Brand & Product Code

Bidder's
Terms Pack Size Cost            

per Case
Extended Total          

Cost
Lead Time Comments AWARDS

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 Column 5 Column 6 Column 7 Column 8 Column 9 Column 10 Column 11 Column 12 Column 13 Column 14 Column 15

Bid Submissions That Deviate From What Is Being 
Requested In The Specifications Below Will Be 

Considered A Non Acceptable Vendor Response.

** Indicates available USDA commodity may 
impact actual usage quantities. 

DELIVERIES BEGIN 07/31/2025 THRU 
12/12/2025 

FALL BREAK OCTOBER 13-17 - NO 
DELIVERIES THIS WEEK

THANKSGIVING BREAK NOVEMBER 24-28 - 
NO DELIVERIES THIS WEEK 

CHRISTMAS BREAK DECEMBER 22, 2025- 
JANUARY 5, 2026

Pack Sizes listed in the specs are 
reflective of the current awarded 

brand, all pack sizes will be thoroughly 
evaluated for approval. 

Items listed are Pre-Approved 
Brands. MSCS will accept an 

item: (1) as long as it meets the 
bid specification and (2) tested 
and approved through MSCS's 

Sample Submission Process.

ALL SHIP 
LOTS ARE IN 

CASES.

67

68

69

70

1491 CASE

Tomatoes, Diced, No Added Salt, - Canned , packed to 
U.S. grade B standards or better. Packed: 6/#10 
cans/case.  Must have 140mg of sodium or less per 
serving.  

Ship Lot: 250

Angela Mia 38067
Red Gold REDBQ9B                                 
Furmano F11390                                     
Red Gold REDBQ9B

500 Robbins Sales 
Co. Inc. F11390 Furmano F11390 Net 30 6/#10 $30.78 $15,390.00 21 Days

1491 CASE

Tomatoes, Diced, No Added Salt, - Canned , packed to 
U.S. grade B standards or better. Packed: 6/#10 
cans/case.  Must have 140mg of sodium or less per 
serving.  

Ship Lot: 250

Angela Mia 38067
Red Gold REDBQ9B                                 
Furmano F11390                                     
Red Gold REDBQ9B

500 Sysco Memphis 
LLC 38067 Angela Mia - 3896446 NET30 6/10# $27.44 $13,720.00 2-weeks

1569 CASE

Green Beans, Cut, Canned - Packed to U.S. Grade A 
standards.  6/#10 cans per case.   Approx. drained 
weight 60oz. per can.                                                                                                                                                 

Ship Lot: 952

Mother's Maid/Deshler 42396-25539
GFS/LAKESIDE 118737
LAKESIDE/PORT ROYAL 01316
Allen 1224
Sunfield 700200
Our House OHGB610                                               
Del Monte 2004501                                
McCall/Margaret Holmes 10727
Golden Harvest 19211-77707
Madison 75757
Monarch 2410010238

1904 CHURCHFIELD 
TRADING OHGB610 OUR HOUSE 

OHGB610 NET 30 6/ #10 $25.49 $48,532.96 14 DAYS

2025-2026 SY Can-Pouch Bid I 



Memphis Shelby County Schools (MSCS) 
Division of Nutrition Services

2025 - 2026 1st Semester Canned and Pouch Bid
July 31, 2025 - December 12, 2025

1
2

3

A B C D E F G H I J K L M N O

Stock 
Number Unit Description                                                            Approved Brands

(Manufacture Product Code)
  2025-2026 SY Estimated Cases

July 31, 2025 - December 12, 2025       
Bidder

 
Manufacturer's 

Product
Code

Bidder's
Brand & Product Code

Bidder's
Terms Pack Size Cost            

per Case
Extended Total          

Cost
Lead Time Comments AWARDS

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 Column 5 Column 6 Column 7 Column 8 Column 9 Column 10 Column 11 Column 12 Column 13 Column 14 Column 15

Bid Submissions That Deviate From What Is Being 
Requested In The Specifications Below Will Be 

Considered A Non Acceptable Vendor Response.

** Indicates available USDA commodity may 
impact actual usage quantities. 

DELIVERIES BEGIN 07/31/2025 THRU 
12/12/2025 

FALL BREAK OCTOBER 13-17 - NO 
DELIVERIES THIS WEEK

THANKSGIVING BREAK NOVEMBER 24-28 - 
NO DELIVERIES THIS WEEK 

CHRISTMAS BREAK DECEMBER 22, 2025- 
JANUARY 5, 2026

Pack Sizes listed in the specs are 
reflective of the current awarded 

brand, all pack sizes will be thoroughly 
evaluated for approval. 

Items listed are Pre-Approved 
Brands. MSCS will accept an 

item: (1) as long as it meets the 
bid specification and (2) tested 
and approved through MSCS's 

Sample Submission Process.

ALL SHIP 
LOTS ARE IN 

CASES.

71

72

73

74

1569 CASE

Green Beans, Cut, Canned - Packed to U.S. Grade A 
standards.  6/#10 cans per case.   Approx. drained 
weight 60oz. per can.                                                                                                                                                 

Ship Lot: 952

Mother's Maid/Deshler 42396-25539
GFS/LAKESIDE 118737
LAKESIDE/PORT ROYAL 01316
Allen 1224
Sunfield 700200
Our House OHGB610                                               
Del Monte 2004501                                
McCall/Margaret Holmes 10727
Golden Harvest 19211-77707
Madison 75757
Monarch 2410010238

1904 Robbins Sales 
Co. Inc. 19211-77707 Golden Harvest 19211-

77707
Net 30 6/#10 $25.98 $49,465.92 21 Days

1569 CASE

Green Beans, Cut, Canned - Packed to U.S. Grade A 
standards.  6/#10 cans per case.   Approx. drained 
weight 60oz. per can.                                                                                                                                                 

Ship Lot: 952

Mother's Maid/Deshler 42396-25539
GFS/LAKESIDE 118737
LAKESIDE/PORT ROYAL 01316
Allen 1224
Sunfield 700200
Our House OHGB610                                               
Del Monte 2004501                                
McCall/Margaret Holmes 10727
Golden Harvest 19211-77707
Madison 75757
Monarch 2410010238

1904 National Food 
Group 606843 / 25539 National Food Group/ 

Mothers Maid
Net 30 6/ #10 $23.32 $44,401.28 21 day lead 

time

Truckload quantity with the pallet 
height requirements for MSCS 

warehouse at 816 cases

AWARD

1569 CASE

Green Beans, Cut, Canned - Packed to U.S. Grade A 
standards.  6/#10 cans per case.   Approx. drained 
weight 60oz. per can.                                                                                                                                                 

Ship Lot: 952

Mother's Maid/Deshler 42396-25539
GFS/LAKESIDE 118737
LAKESIDE/PORT ROYAL 01316
Allen 1224
Sunfield 700200
Our House OHGB610                                               
Del Monte 2004501                                
McCall/Margaret Holmes 10727
Golden Harvest 19211-77707
Madison 75757
Monarch 2410010238

1904 Sysco Memphis 
LLC 2004501 Delmonte - 7038380 NET30 6/10# $30.39 $57,862.56 2-weeks

2025-2026 SY Can-Pouch Bid I 



Memphis Shelby County Schools (MSCS) 
Division of Nutrition Services

2025 - 2026 1st Semester Canned and Pouch Bid
July 31, 2025 - December 12, 2025

1
2

3

A B C D E F G H I J K L M N O

Stock 
Number Unit Description                                                            Approved Brands

(Manufacture Product Code)
  2025-2026 SY Estimated Cases

July 31, 2025 - December 12, 2025       
Bidder

 
Manufacturer's 

Product
Code

Bidder's
Brand & Product Code

Bidder's
Terms Pack Size Cost            

per Case
Extended Total          

Cost
Lead Time Comments AWARDS

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 Column 5 Column 6 Column 7 Column 8 Column 9 Column 10 Column 11 Column 12 Column 13 Column 14 Column 15

Bid Submissions That Deviate From What Is Being 
Requested In The Specifications Below Will Be 

Considered A Non Acceptable Vendor Response.

** Indicates available USDA commodity may 
impact actual usage quantities. 

DELIVERIES BEGIN 07/31/2025 THRU 
12/12/2025 

FALL BREAK OCTOBER 13-17 - NO 
DELIVERIES THIS WEEK

THANKSGIVING BREAK NOVEMBER 24-28 - 
NO DELIVERIES THIS WEEK 

CHRISTMAS BREAK DECEMBER 22, 2025- 
JANUARY 5, 2026

Pack Sizes listed in the specs are 
reflective of the current awarded 

brand, all pack sizes will be thoroughly 
evaluated for approval. 

Items listed are Pre-Approved 
Brands. MSCS will accept an 

item: (1) as long as it meets the 
bid specification and (2) tested 
and approved through MSCS's 

Sample Submission Process.

ALL SHIP 
LOTS ARE IN 

CASES.

75

76

77

78

79

1905 CASE

Beans, Baked, Vegetarian, Canned -  Packed to U.S. 
Grade A standard, 6 #10 cans/case, must be low 
sodium.  Minimum Drained Weight: 68 oz. 

Ship Lot: 952               

Bush 1638

3808 CHURCHFIELD 
TRADING OHVB610 OUR HOUSE  

OHVB610 NET 30 6/ #10 $27.81 $105,900.48 14 DAYS

AWARD

SAMPLE SENT SAMPLE 
PASSED

ADD AS APPROVED 
BRAND

1905 CASE

Beans, Baked, Vegetarian, Canned -  Packed to U.S. 
Grade A standard, 6 #10 cans/case, must be low 
sodium.  Minimum Drained Weight: 68 oz. 

Ship Lot: 952               

Bush 1638

3808 National Food 
Group 606847 / 25231 National Food Group/ 

Mothers Maid Net 30 6/ #10 $29.48 $112,259.84 21 day lead 
time

Truckload quantity with the pallet 
height requirements for MSCS 

warehouse at 816 cases

1905 CASE

Beans, Baked, Vegetarian, Canned -  Packed to U.S. 
Grade A standard, 6 #10 cans/case, must be low 
sodium.  Minimum Drained Weight: 68 oz. 

Ship Lot: 952               

Bush 1638

3808 Sysco Memphis 
LLC 01638 Bush - 3560143 NET30 6/10# $45.38 $172,807.04 2-weeks

1906 CASE

Beans, Black Taco Flavored– Dark, rich colored,  
vegetarian Black beans in a taco flavored tomato 
sauce with corn.  Serving to equal ½ cup for the Child 
Nutrition Program. Canned - Packed to U.S. Grade A 
standards, must be low sodium.  6/#10 cans per case.   
Approx. drained weight 60oz. per can.

Ship Lot: 476  

Bush's 01585

1904 Sysco Memphis 
LLC 01585 Bush - 3560127 NET30 6/108oz $45.66 $86,936.64 2-weeks AWARD

2025-2026 SY Can-Pouch Bid I 



Memphis Shelby County Schools (MSCS) 
Division of Nutrition Services

2025 - 2026 1st Semester Canned and Pouch Bid
July 31, 2025 - December 12, 2025

1
2

3

A B C D E F G H I J K L M N O

Stock 
Number Unit Description                                                            Approved Brands

(Manufacture Product Code)
  2025-2026 SY Estimated Cases

July 31, 2025 - December 12, 2025       
Bidder

 
Manufacturer's 

Product
Code

Bidder's
Brand & Product Code

Bidder's
Terms Pack Size Cost            

per Case
Extended Total          

Cost
Lead Time Comments AWARDS

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 Column 5 Column 6 Column 7 Column 8 Column 9 Column 10 Column 11 Column 12 Column 13 Column 14 Column 15

Bid Submissions That Deviate From What Is Being 
Requested In The Specifications Below Will Be 

Considered A Non Acceptable Vendor Response.

** Indicates available USDA commodity may 
impact actual usage quantities. 

DELIVERIES BEGIN 07/31/2025 THRU 
12/12/2025 

FALL BREAK OCTOBER 13-17 - NO 
DELIVERIES THIS WEEK

THANKSGIVING BREAK NOVEMBER 24-28 - 
NO DELIVERIES THIS WEEK 

CHRISTMAS BREAK DECEMBER 22, 2025- 
JANUARY 5, 2026

Pack Sizes listed in the specs are 
reflective of the current awarded 

brand, all pack sizes will be thoroughly 
evaluated for approval. 

Items listed are Pre-Approved 
Brands. MSCS will accept an 

item: (1) as long as it meets the 
bid specification and (2) tested 
and approved through MSCS's 

Sample Submission Process.

ALL SHIP 
LOTS ARE IN 

CASES.

80

81

82

83

84

85

86

1909 CASE

Beans, Ranchero Flavored–  Vegetarian pinto beans in 
a southwest flavored sauce.  Serving to equal ½ cup for 
the Child Nutrition Program. Canned - Packed to U.S. 
Grade A standards, must be low sodium.  6/#10 cans 
per case.   Approx. drained weight 60oz. per can.  

Ship Lot: 476 Cases

Bush's 01071

1904 Sysco Memphis 
LLC 01071 Bush - 5064157 NET30 6/10# $45.66 $86,936.64 2-weeks AWARD

1922 CASE

Cheese Sauce, White, Heat and Serve Can – Made 
with real cheese, diced peppers and spices and 
reduced sodium.  Heat and serve.  CN label or 
crediting state required. Approx. pack 6 cans per case.  
If packed differently, please indicated. 

Ship Lot: 200 Cases

Nestle/ Chefmate 50000477760

2000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.00 NO BID

2338 CASE

Tomatoes, Diced, w/Green Chiles - Canned, diced 
omatoeswith chopped green chiles, packed in water 
and tomato juice.  Packed to U.s. GRADE b standards 
or better. Packed in 28 oz. cans. Minimal drained 
weight equals 18 oz.  If packed differnetly, please 
indicated. 

SHip Lot: 200 Cases

Red GoLd REDBK2RC 12 

600 Red Gold REDBK2RC12 REDBK2RC12 Net 30 12 / 28 oz can $22.81 $13,686.00
10 

Business 
Days

Price provided is for Half 
Truckload, 13 pallets/20,000 

pounds.  Truck can be a mix of 
awarded products shipped in full 

pallet quantity. Direct ship to 
Shelby County Central 

Warehouse.

AWARD

2025-2026 SY Can-Pouch Bid I 
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