
Memphis-Shelby County Schools (MSCS)
Division of Nutrition Services

2025-2026 Miscellaneous Food Bid I
Frozen By the Serving

Stock 
Number Unit Description Approved Brand                                          

(Manufacturer Product Code)

Estimated Number 
of Servings 
 (2025-2026)

Bidder Bidder Terms Bidder Brand  Manufacturer's 
Product Code

Pack                                       
Size

Estimated Servings 
Per Case Cost Per Serving 

Required 
Number of 

Cases
Cost Per Case Extended Total 

Cost Comments
LEAD TIME FROM 

ORDER 
(IN WEEKS)

AWARD

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 Column 5 Column 6 Column 7 Column 8 Column 9 Column 10 Column 11 Column 12 Column 13 Column 14 Column 15 Column 16 Column 17

Bid Submissions That Deviate From What Is Being Requested In 
The Specifications Below Will Be Considered A Non Acceptable 

Vendor Response.

PACK SIZES FOR THE FOLLOWING 
SPECIFICATIONS REFLECT CURRENT 
AWARDS.  ALL PACK SIZES WILL BE 
THOROUGHLY CONSIDERED AND 

EVALUATED.

Items listed are Pre-
Approved Brands, MSCS 
will accept an approved 

equal (1) as long as it 
meets the bid 

specification and (2) 
tested and approved 

through MSCS's Sample 
Submission Process.

ALL SHIP LOTS ARE IN 
CASES.

1172 SERVINGS

Fruit, Strawberry Cup, Frozen- Frozen fruit  cup made with frozen 
strawberries. Each serving to meet ½ cup eq of fruit per USDA child 
nutrition program guidelines. Must be frozen and made with 100% 
fruit juice and no added sugars.  Crediting statement or CN label 
required.  Strawberry 
Packed approximately 96 servings per case.

Ship Lot: 300 Cases 

Wawona Frozen Foods 059680-
77

300,000 No Bid #DIV/0! $0.00 #DIV/0! NO BID

1471 SERVINGS

Veg, Potato Wedge - 8-Cut skin-on potato wedge. Hearty 
hand cut appeal. Frozen, Ovenable contains zero grams of 
trans fat. One serving portion equals 1/2 cup cooked 
vegetable. Approximate pack: 6X 5lb. bags per case.                                                                   

Ship Lot: 500 Cases 

No Approved Brands

250,000 McCain Foods USA, 
Inc 2% 10 net 15 McCain 1000000496 6/5 lb 166 $0.16 1,506 $26.93 $40,550.00 2 weeks

AWARD

SAMPLE SENT 
SAMPLE PASSED

ADD AS 
APPROVED 

BRAND

1471 SERVINGS

Veg, Potato Wedge - 8-Cut skin-on potato wedge. Hearty 
hand cut appeal. Frozen, Ovenable contains zero grams of 
trans fat. One serving portion equals 1/2 cup cooked 
vegetable. Approximate pack: 6X 5lb. bags per case.                                                                   

Ship Lot: 500 Cases 

No Approved Brands

250,000 CHURCHFIELD 
TRADING 

NET 30 LAMB WESTON C27 6/5# 160 $0.38 1,563 $60.96 $95,250.00 500 cs min order 21 days 

SAMPLE SENT 
SAMPLE PASSED

ADD AS 
APPROVED 

BRAND

1471 SERVINGS

Veg, Potato Wedge - 8-Cut skin-on potato wedge. Hearty 
hand cut appeal. Frozen, Ovenable contains zero grams of 
trans fat. One serving portion equals 1/2 cup cooked 
vegetable. Approximate pack: 6X 5lb. bags per case.                                                                   

Ship Lot: 500 Cases 

No Approved Brands

250,000 Robbins Sales 
Company Inc

N30 Mart Frozen Foods MFF00403 6/5lb 178 $0.2303 1,404 $41.00 $57,582.50 500 case minimum 
shipment required 3

1471 SERVINGS

Veg, Potato Wedge - 8-Cut skin-on potato wedge. Hearty 
hand cut appeal. Frozen, Ovenable contains zero grams of 
trans fat. One serving portion equals 1/2 cup cooked 
vegetable. Approximate pack: 6X 5lb. bags per case.                                                                   

Ship Lot: 500 Cases 

No Approved Brands

250,000 J.R. Simplot 
Company 

2% 10 net 15 
days from 

invoice or 30 
days net

Simplot 
SeasonedCRISP 

Delivery +
10071179478089' 6/5# 165.51 $0.22 1,510 $36.88 $55,706.60 2 Weeks (14 Days)

SAMPLE SENT 
SAMPLE PASSED

ADD AS 
APPROVED 

BRAND

1663 SERVINGS

Grab and Go, Deli Meal, Turkey Ham - Entire serving must 
meet a minimum of 2.0 meat/meat alternative and 2.0 oz 
Grain Equivalents for the Child Nutrition Program.  (Must 
specify USDA commodity code used and value per pound) 
Approximate pack: 48-3.93 oz servings per case.                                                                             

SHIP LOT: 300 Cases

Tasty Brands 10206 

200,000 Tasty Brands 1%10, net 20 Tasty Brands 10206 48/4.58 48 $1.58 4,167 $76.04 $316,820.00 5000# minimum 
ship 2 AWARD
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Memphis-Shelby County Schools (MSCS)
Division of Nutrition Services

2025-2026 Miscellaneous Food Bid I
Frozen By the Serving

Stock 
Number Unit Description Approved Brand                                          

(Manufacturer Product Code)

Estimated Number 
of Servings 
 (2025-2026)

Bidder Bidder Terms Bidder Brand  Manufacturer's 
Product Code

Pack                                       
Size

Estimated Servings 
Per Case Cost Per Serving 

Required 
Number of 

Cases
Cost Per Case Extended Total 

Cost Comments
LEAD TIME FROM 

ORDER 
(IN WEEKS)

AWARD

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 Column 5 Column 6 Column 7 Column 8 Column 9 Column 10 Column 11 Column 12 Column 13 Column 14 Column 15 Column 16 Column 17

Bid Submissions That Deviate From What Is Being Requested In 
The Specifications Below Will Be Considered A Non Acceptable 

Vendor Response.

PACK SIZES FOR THE FOLLOWING 
SPECIFICATIONS REFLECT CURRENT 
AWARDS.  ALL PACK SIZES WILL BE 
THOROUGHLY CONSIDERED AND 

EVALUATED.

Items listed are Pre-
Approved Brands, MSCS 
will accept an approved 

equal (1) as long as it 
meets the bid 

specification and (2) 
tested and approved 

through MSCS's Sample 
Submission Process.

ALL SHIP LOTS ARE IN 
CASES.

1664 SERVINGS

Grab and Go, Deli Meal, Turkey Pepperoni Meal - To 
contain turkey pepperoni, mozzarella cheese, marinara 
sauce and whole grain flat bread rounds. Entire serving must 
meet a minimum of 2.0 meat/meat alternative and 2.0 oz 
Grain Equivalents for the Child Nutrition Program.  
Approximate pack: 48 - 5.43 oz servings per case.                                                                             

Ship Lot: 500 Cases 

 

150,000 Tasty Brands 1%10, net 20 Tasty Brands 10102 48/5.58 48 $1.63 3,125 $78.36 $244,875.00 5000# minimum 
ship 2 AWARD

1886 SERVINGS

Soup, Broccoli and Cheese, Frozen - In 8/4 lb boil in bags. 
Contains vibrant green broccoli an a rich cheese sauce.  
Must meet 1 oz meat/meat alternate and 1/2 cup vegetable 
per serving.   Please provide CN label or product formulation 
sheet for crediting.                                                                                            

Ship Lot: 100 Cases

No Approved Brands

75,000 JTM Net 30 JTM 5114
6 bags
30.00# 
case

80 $0.8484 938 $67.87 $63,630.00

Direct orders:
4200 Lbs.

Distributor orders
4200 Lbs.

Can be mixed 
product & must 
order in layers.

3 weeks
(21 days)

SAMPLE SENT 
SAMPLE FAILED

1886 SERVINGS

Soup, Broccoli and Cheese, Frozen - In 8/4 lb boil in bags. 
Contains vibrant green broccoli an a rich cheese sauce.  
Must meet 1 oz meat/meat alternate and 1/2 cup vegetable 
per serving.   Please provide CN label or product formulation 
sheet for crediting.                                                                                            

Ship Lot: 100 Cases

No Approved Brands

75,000 VENDISCO NET 14 VENDISCO CN80030 8/4# cs 62.82208589 $1.53 1,194 $96.01 $114,621.31 4 weeks

AWARD

SAMPLE SENT 
SAMPLE PASSED

ADD AS 
APPROVED 

BRAND

2311 SERVINGS

Green Chicken Enchiladas, Bulk - whole grain corn tortilla 
containing white chicken meat, tomatillo, cheese with a 
green verde sauce. Packed approximately 35 servings per 
case.  

Ship Lot:  400 Cases

Fresh Start GCECO2

210,000 Fresh Start Healthy 
Meals Net 21 Fresh Start Healthy Meals GCEC02 1/20.5 lb 35 $1.61 6,000 $56.35 $338,100.00

Direct delivered 400 
cases minimum 
(mixed orders 

accepted)

4 week delivery lead 
time AWARD

2341 SERVINGS

Soup, Chicken Tortilla - Flavorful Southwestern loaded 
soup with chicken, beans, tomatoes, corn, mexican 
seasonings, and tortilla strips. Approximately packed 4/ 4 
pound bags per case. If packed differently, please indicate.

Ship Lot: 300 Cases

Soup Sensations/Norpac 
117105

100,000 No Bid #DIV/0! $0.00 #DIV/0! NO BID

2342 SERVINGS

Green Chicken Enchiladas, Individually - whole grain corn 
tortilla containing white chicken meat, tomatillo, cheese with 
a green verde sauce.  

Ship Lot:  400 Cases

Fresh Start GCECO1

75,000 Fresh Start Healthy 
Meals Net 21 Fresh Start Healthy Meals GCEC01 64/8.85oz 64 $1.75 1,172 $112.00 $131,250.00

Direct delivered 400 
cases minimum 
(mixed orders 

accepted)

4 week delivery lead 
time AWARD
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Memphis-Shelby County Schools (MSCS)
Division of Nutrition Services

2025-2026 Miscellaneous Food Bid I
Frozen By the Serving

Stock 
Number Unit Description Approved Brand                                          

(Manufacturer Product Code)

Estimated Number 
of Servings 
 (2025-2026)

Bidder Bidder Terms Bidder Brand  Manufacturer's 
Product Code

Pack                                       
Size

Estimated Servings 
Per Case Cost Per Serving 

Required 
Number of 

Cases
Cost Per Case Extended Total 

Cost Comments
LEAD TIME FROM 

ORDER 
(IN WEEKS)

AWARD

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 Column 5 Column 6 Column 7 Column 8 Column 9 Column 10 Column 11 Column 12 Column 13 Column 14 Column 15 Column 16 Column 17

Bid Submissions That Deviate From What Is Being Requested In 
The Specifications Below Will Be Considered A Non Acceptable 

Vendor Response.

PACK SIZES FOR THE FOLLOWING 
SPECIFICATIONS REFLECT CURRENT 
AWARDS.  ALL PACK SIZES WILL BE 
THOROUGHLY CONSIDERED AND 

EVALUATED.

Items listed are Pre-
Approved Brands, MSCS 
will accept an approved 

equal (1) as long as it 
meets the bid 

specification and (2) 
tested and approved 

through MSCS's Sample 
Submission Process.

ALL SHIP LOTS ARE IN 
CASES.

2354 CASE

Tortilla, Flour - Shelf stable tortilla product to be frozen. 
Each tortilla must be a 10" diameter and meet a minimum of 
2 oz. grain equivalents per child nutrition program standards.  
CN label or grain crediting statement required.  Approximate 
pack 192 count per case. Please indicate if packed 
differently.

Ship Lot: 100 Cases

Tyson 10077130621

80,000 Tyson Net 30 Days MEXICAN ORIGINAL 10077130621 192 / 2.29 oz. 192 $0.1666 $31.98 $416.67 $13,325.00 2 Weeks AWARD

3001 SERVINGS

Italian Combo Brioche, WG IW - Individuallly wrapped 
Italian combo premium meat on a soft, buttery brioche bun. 
Sandwich made with a combination of turkey ham turkey 
pepperoni, and turkey salami, and mozzerella cheese. Must 
meet a minimum of 2 oz. m/ma and 2 oz. whole grain for the 
Child Nutrition Program.  Must provide CN statement and/or 
product formulation sheet for crediting.  Packed 
approximately 72 servings per case.

Ship Lot: 300 Cases

Tasty Brands 70014

200,000 Tasty Brands 1%10, net 20 Tasty Brands 70014 72/4.36 72 $1.13 2,778 $81.53 $226,460.00 5000# minimum 
ship 2 AWARD

3020 SERVINGS

Casserole, Sweet Potato - Ready to be baked frozen. 
Sweet potato casserole, sweet and savory, light and fluffy 
made from US Grade A standard sweet potatoes. No tree 
nuts or pecans. To contain eggs, butter, and milk. Each 
serving must meet 1/2 cup of vegetables. Please indicate 
serving size. Please provide CN label or product 
formulation sheet for crediting. Approximately packed 75 per 
case.  Please indicate if packed differently.

Ship Lot: 300 Cases

No Approved Brands

200,000 Savannah Foods 1/10 net 11 Savannah Classic 36109 4/4.5 75 $0.72 2,667 $54.00 $144,000.00 3

AWARD

SAMPLE SENT 
SAMPLE PASSED

ADD AS 
APPROVED 

BRAND

3021 SERVINGS

Ham, Buffet Pre-Sliced - Fully cooked boneless, pre-sliced, 
buffet style ham. Each serving slice must credit as 1 oz. 
meat/meat alternate for the Child Nutrition Program.

Ship Lot: 300 Cases

No Approved Brands

250,000 No Bid #DIV/0! $0.00 #DIV/0! NO BID
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Memphis-Shelby County Schools (MSCS)
Division of Nutrition Services

2025-2026 Miscellaneous Food Bid I
Frozen By the Serving

Stock 
Number Unit Description Approved Brand                                          

(Manufacturer Product Code)

Estimated Number 
of Servings 
 (2025-2026)

Bidder Bidder Terms Bidder Brand  Manufacturer's 
Product Code

Pack                                       
Size

Estimated Servings 
Per Case Cost Per Serving 

Required 
Number of 

Cases
Cost Per Case Extended Total 

Cost Comments
LEAD TIME FROM 

ORDER 
(IN WEEKS)

AWARD

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 Column 5 Column 6 Column 7 Column 8 Column 9 Column 10 Column 11 Column 12 Column 13 Column 14 Column 15 Column 16 Column 17

Bid Submissions That Deviate From What Is Being Requested In 
The Specifications Below Will Be Considered A Non Acceptable 

Vendor Response.

PACK SIZES FOR THE FOLLOWING 
SPECIFICATIONS REFLECT CURRENT 
AWARDS.  ALL PACK SIZES WILL BE 
THOROUGHLY CONSIDERED AND 

EVALUATED.

Items listed are Pre-
Approved Brands, MSCS 
will accept an approved 

equal (1) as long as it 
meets the bid 

specification and (2) 
tested and approved 

through MSCS's Sample 
Submission Process.

ALL SHIP LOTS ARE IN 
CASES.

3032 SERVINGS

French Toast, Apple Cinnamon, WG, IW- WG Toast topped 
with an apple cinnamon sauce. Each serving to provide 2 oz 
grain equivalent for the Child Nutrition Program. Grain 
credibility statement required. CN labeled. Approximate 
pack: 100-3.0 servings per case. 

Ship Lot:  400 Cases

S&F Foods 128MC

200,000 CHURCHFIELD 
TRADING NET 30 S&F FOODS 128MC 96/3.3oz 96 $0.77 2,083 $73.82 $153,791.67 21 days 

3032 SERVINGS

French Toast, Apple Cinnamon, WG, IW- WG Toast topped 
with an apple cinnamon sauce. Each serving to provide 2 oz 
grain equivalent for the Child Nutrition Program. Grain 
credibility statement required. CN labeled. Approximate 
pack: 100-3.0 servings per case. 

Ship Lot:  400 Cases

S&F Foods 128MC

200,000 S&F Foods Inc.  min mix and matc  S&F Foods Inc. 128MC 96/3.3oz 96 $0.60 2,083 $57.63 $120,060.00 4 weeks AWARD

3116 SERVINGS

Cherry Frudel, IW- Frozen single serve pouch cherry, 
individually wrapped in oven safe film. Ovenable film for heat 
and serve or  thaw and serve Must meet 2 oz. grain 
equivalent. Must provide CN or crediting statement and 
smart snack guidelines. Packed approximately 72 servings 
per case.

Ship Lot: 200 Cases

Pillsbury 515800

150,000 CHURCHFIELD 
TRADING NET 30 PILLSBURY 515800 72/2.29 OZ 72 $0.55 2,083 $39.87 $83,062.50 14-21 days               

min order 432 cs AWARD

3117 SERVINGS

Apple Frudel, IW- Frozen single serve pouch apple, 
individually wrapped in oven safe film. Ovenable film for heat 
and serve or  thaw and serve. Must meet 2 oz. grain 
equivalent. Must provide CN or crediting statement and 
smart snack guidelines. Packed approximately 72 servings 
per case.

Ship Lot: 200 Cases

Pillsbury 57388

150,000 CHURCHFIELD 
TRADING NET 30 PILLSBURY 57388 72/2.29 OZ 72 $0.55 2,083 $39.87 $83,062.50 14-21 days               

min order 432 cs AWARD

3118 SERVINGS

Cinnamon Roll -  Freeerto Oven whole grain cinamon roll 
dough. Must meet 2 oz. grain equivalent. Must provide CN or 
crediting statement and smart snack guidelines. Packed 
approximately 100 servings per case.

Ship Lot: 200 Cases

Pillsbury 94562-11111-0

50,000 CHURCHFIELD 
TRADING 

NET 30 PILLSBURY 94562 94/2.872 OZ 94 $0.38 532 $35.72 $19,000.00 14-21 days                  
min order 300 cs AWARD
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Memphis-Shelby County Schools (MSCS)
Division of Nutrition Services

2025-2026 Miscellaneous Food Bid I
Frozen By the Serving

Stock 
Number Unit Description Approved Brand                                          

(Manufacturer Product Code)

Estimated Number 
of Servings 
 (2025-2026)

Bidder Bidder Terms Bidder Brand  Manufacturer's 
Product Code

Pack                                       
Size

Estimated Servings 
Per Case Cost Per Serving 

Required 
Number of 

Cases
Cost Per Case Extended Total 

Cost Comments
LEAD TIME FROM 

ORDER 
(IN WEEKS)

AWARD

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 Column 5 Column 6 Column 7 Column 8 Column 9 Column 10 Column 11 Column 12 Column 13 Column 14 Column 15 Column 16 Column 17

Bid Submissions That Deviate From What Is Being Requested In 
The Specifications Below Will Be Considered A Non Acceptable 

Vendor Response.

PACK SIZES FOR THE FOLLOWING 
SPECIFICATIONS REFLECT CURRENT 
AWARDS.  ALL PACK SIZES WILL BE 
THOROUGHLY CONSIDERED AND 

EVALUATED.

Items listed are Pre-
Approved Brands, MSCS 
will accept an approved 

equal (1) as long as it 
meets the bid 

specification and (2) 
tested and approved 

through MSCS's Sample 
Submission Process.

ALL SHIP LOTS ARE IN 
CASES.

3119 SERVINGS

Sandwich, Grilled Cheese, IW -  Grilled cheese on whole 
grain sandwich bread. Reduced fat and reduced sodium, 
made with American Cheese.  Must meet 2 oz. grain 
equivalent and 2 oz. meat/meat alternate Must provide CN or 
crediting statement and smart snack guidelines. Packed 
approximately 72 per case.

Ship Lot: 400 Cases

No Approved Brands

200,000 Integrated Food 
Service 

NET 30 Days Hot Off The Grill 108000 72/4.19 oz. 72 $0.94 2,778 $67.32 $187,000.00 4 weeks

SAMPLE SENT 
SAMPLE PASSED

ADD AS 
APPROVED 

BRAND

3119 SERVINGS

Sandwich, Grilled Cheese, IW -  Grilled cheese on whole 
grain sandwich bread. Reduced fat and reduced sodium, 
made with American Cheese.  Must meet 2 oz. grain 
equivalent and 2 oz. meat/meat alternate Must provide CN or 
crediting statement and smart snack guidelines. Packed 
approximately 72 per case.

Ship Lot: 400 Cases

No Approved Brands

200,000 Tasty Brands 1%10, net 20 Tasty Brands 70110 108/4.00 108 $0.87 1,852 $93.96 $174,000.00 5000# minimum 
ship 2

AWARD

SAMPLE SENT 
SAMPLE PASSED

ADD AS 
APPROVED 

BRAND

3119 SERVINGS

Sandwich, Grilled Cheese, IW -  Grilled cheese on whole 
grain sandwich bread. Reduced fat and reduced sodium, 
made with American Cheese.  Must meet 2 oz. grain 
equivalent and 2 oz. meat/meat alternate Must provide CN or 
crediting statement and smart snack guidelines. Packed 
approximately 72 per case.

Ship Lot: 400 Cases

No Approved Brands

200,000 Bake Crafters Bake Crafters 6676 108 108 $1.00 1,852 $107.99 $199,981.48 3 weeks

SAMPLE SENT 
SAMPLE PASSED

ADD AS 
APPROVED 

BRAND

3119 SERVINGS

Sandwich, Grilled Cheese, IW -  Grilled cheese on whole 
grain sandwich bread. Reduced fat and reduced sodium, 
made with American Cheese.  Must meet 2 oz. grain 
equivalent and 2 oz. meat/meat alternate Must provide CN or 
crediting statement and smart snack guidelines. Packed 
approximately 72 per case.

Ship Lot: 400 Cases

No Approved Brands

200,000 Integrated Food 
Service NET 30 Days Hot Off The Grill 134000 72/4.19 oz. 72 $0.94 2,778 $67.32 $187,000.00 4 weeks

SAMPLE SENT 
SAMPLE PASSED

ADD AS 
APPROVED 

BRAND
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Memphis-Shelby County Schools (MSCS)
Division of Nutrition Services

2025-2026 Miscellaneous Food Bid I
Frozen By the Pound

Stock Number Unit Description
Approved Brand                                          

(Manufacture Product Code)
Estimated Number of 

Units  (2025-2026)
Bidder Bidder Terms Bidder Brand

Manufacturer's 
Product Code

Pack                                       
Size

Estimated Pounds Per 
Case

Cost Per Pound
Estimated 

Servings/Pounds 
Per Case

Required 
Number of 

Cases Needed
Cost Per Extended Total Cost Comments

Lead Time From 
Order in Weeks AWARD

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 Column 5 Column 6 Column 7 Column 8 Column 9 Column 10 Column 11 Column 12 Column 13 Column 14 Column 15 Column 16 Column 17 Column 18 Column 19

Bid Submissions That Deviate From What Is 
Being Requested In The Specifications Below 
Will Be Considered A Non Acceptable Vendor 

Response.

PACK SIZES FOR THE 
FOLLOWING SPECIFICATIONS 
REFLECT CURRENT AWARDS.  

ALL PACK SIZES WILL BE 
THOROUGHLY CONSIDERED 

AND EVALUATED.

Items listed are Pre-
Approved Brands, MSCS 
will accept an approved 

equal (1) as long as it 
meets the bid 

specification and (2) 
tested and approved 

through MSCS's Sample 
Submission Process.

ALL SHIP LOTS ARE IN 
CASES.

1008 POUND

Ground Beef Crumbles, Frozen – 
Must be made from 100% ground 
beef fully cooked. Vacuumed 
sealed and slow cooked in sous 
vide method. Must provide at least 
2 oz meat/meat alternate 
equivalent for the Child Nutrition 
Program.  Crumbles should be 
brown in color when fully cooked. 
Approximate Pack: 20-lb case.     

Ship Lot:  400 

Cuisine Solutions 
1005631

168,000 JTM Net 30 JTM 5892CE 6 bags
30.00# case 30 $5.4537 177 949 $163.61 $155,291.80

Direct 
orders:

4200 Lbs.
Distributor 

orders
4200 Lbs.

Can be 
mixed 

product & 
must order 

in layers.

3 weeks
(21 days) AWARD



Memphis-Shelby County Schools (MSCS)
Division of Nutrition Services

2025-2026 Miscellaneous Food Bid I
Dry By the Serving or Each

Stock 
Number Unit Description Approved Brand

(Manufacture Product Code)
Estimated Number of Servings 

(2025-2026) Bidder Bidder
Terms

Bidder 
Brand

 Manufacturer's 
Product Code Pack Size Estimated Servings 

Per Case

Cost
Per

Serving

Cost
Per

Case

Required 
Number of 

Cases

Extended
 Total
Cost

Comments
LEAD TIME 

FROM ORDER 
(IN WEEKS)

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 Column 5 Column 6 Column 7 Column 8 Column 9 Column 10 Column 11 Column 12 Column 13 Column 14 Column 15 Column 16 Column 17

Bid Submissions That Deviate From What Is Being 
Requested In The Specifications Below Will Be 

Considered A Non Acceptable Vendor Response.

PACK SIZES FOR THE FOLLOWING 
SPECIFICATIONS REFLECT 

CURRENT AWARDS.  ALL PACK 
SIZES WILL BE THOROUGHLY 

CONSIDERED AND EVALUATED.

Items listed are Pre-Approved 
Brands, MSCS will accept an 
approved equal (1) as long as 
it meets the bid specification 
and (2) tested and approved 

through MSCS's Sample 
Submission Process.

ALL SHIP LOTS 
ARE IN CASES.

1503 SERVINGS

Bottled Water, Unflavored - Purified, non-carbonated, 
caffeine free and sugar-free.  Packed in twist cap plastic 
bottle.  Each bottle to yield 16.9 oz water. Approximate 
pack: 24/case.

Ship Lot: 500 Cases

Thirster 767514
Crystal Geyser CGW124514CT

400,000 Ultimate Attire & 
Solutions Net 30 Member's Mark 561914 48 40 $0.18 $7.27 10,000.00 $72,700.00

Only 101,280 
Servings (2,532 
Cases) 
Purchased for 
2024-2025 
School Year

2 Weeks

1503 SERVINGS

Bottled Water, Unflavored - Purified, non-carbonated, 
caffeine free and sugar-free.  Packed in twist cap plastic 
bottle.  Each bottle to yield 16.9 oz water. Approximate 
pack: 24/case.

Ship Lot: 500 Cases

Thirster 767514
Crystal Geyser CGW124514CT

400,000 Robbins Sales 
Company Inc N30 Niagara NDw05L24PDR 24/16.9oz 24 $0.12790 $3.07 16,666.67 $51,160.00

1,596 cases 
minimum order 
required. This is a 
full TL amount, Or 
can be combined 
with 8oz water to 
make full TL.

3

1504 SERVINGS

Bottled Water, Unflavored - Purified, non-carbonated, 
caffeine free and sugar-free.  Packed in twist cap plastic 
bottle.  Each bottle to yield 8 oz water. Approximate 
pack: 24/case.

Ship Lot: 500 Cases

Thirster 894890
Crystal Geyser  CGW124514CT

300,000 Ultimate Attire & 
Solutions Net 30 Member's Mark 852853 48 80 $0.14 $11.49 3,750.00 $43,087.50

Only 246,400 
Servings (3,080 
Cases) 
Purchased for 
2024-2025 
School Year

2 Weeks

1504 SERVINGS

Bottled Water, Unflavored - Purified, non-carbonated, 
caffeine free and sugar-free.  Packed in twist cap plastic 
bottle.  Each bottle to yield 8 oz water. Approximate 
pack: 24/case.

Ship Lot: 500 Cases

Thirster 894890
Crystal Geyser  CGW124514CT

300,000 Robbins Sales 
Company Inc N30 Niagara NDW08OZ24PR 24/8oz 24 $0.12083 $2.90 12,500.00 $36,249.00 3,196 cases 

minimum order 
required. This is a 
full TL amount, Or 
can be combined 
with 16.9oz water 
to make full TL

3

1876 SERVINGS

Milk, Soy, Chocolate Flavored 8 oz- Shelf stable soy 
based milk. To contain all nutrients to qualify as 
reimbursable through the USDA Child Nutrition program 
as fluid milk.

Ship Lot:  200

Silk 0177321
Kikkoman 06185
Silk 136465

100,000 No Bid $0.00 #DIV/0! #DIV/0!
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Memphis-Shelby County Schools (MSCS)
Division of Nutrition Services

2025-2026 Miscellaneous Food Bid I
Dry By the Serving or Each

Stock 
Number Unit Description Approved Brand

(Manufacture Product Code)
Estimated Number of Servings 

(2025-2026) Bidder Bidder
Terms

Bidder 
Brand

 Manufacturer's 
Product Code Pack Size Estimated Servings 

Per Case

Cost
Per

Serving

Cost
Per

Case

Required 
Number of 

Cases

Extended
 Total
Cost

Comments
LEAD TIME 

FROM ORDER 
(IN WEEKS)

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 Column 5 Column 6 Column 7 Column 8 Column 9 Column 10 Column 11 Column 12 Column 13 Column 14 Column 15 Column 16 Column 17

2330 SERVINGS

Soy Sauce, Individual Packets - Low sodium soy 
sauce
packets. Case pack 500 servings. Please indicate if 
packed differently.

Ship Lot: 300

Kikkoman 120

200,000 No Bid $0.00 #DIV/0! #DIV/0!

2346 SERVINGS

Coffee, Cold Brew, Vanilla - Vanilla Latte flavored 
coffee, sweetened with milk. Packed in non breakable 
container. Must be compliant with Smart Snack 
Guidelines. Each bottle to yield 8 oz.  

Approximate Pack: 24/case

Ship Lot: 100 Cases

Heartland-Java House FA10E080 

20,000 Tasty Brands 1%10,net 20 Tasty Brands 68003 24/8.00 24 $1.29 $30.96 833.33 $25,800.00

 **This item must 
be on a PO 

separate from all 
orders, 2 pallet 
minimum order 

required**

2

2347 SERVINGS

Coffee, Cold Brew, Latte - Latte flavored coffee, 
sweetened with milk. Packed in non breakable 
container. Must be compliant with Smart Snack 
Guidelines. Each bottle to yield 8 oz.  

Approximate Pack: 24/case

Ship Lot: 100 Cases

Heartland-Java House FA10E040 

20,000 Tasty Brands 1%10,net 20 Tasty Brands 68002 24/8.00 24 $1.29 $30.96 833.33 $25,800.00

 **This item must 
be on a PO 

separate from all 
orders, 2 pallet 
minimum order 

required**

2
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Memphis-Shelby County Schools (MSCS)
Division of Nutrition Services

2025-2026 Miscellaneous Food Bid I
Dry By the Case 

Stock 
Number Unit Description Approved Brand

(Manufacture Product Code)

Estimated Number of 
Cases

(2025-2026)
Bidder Bidder

Terms
Bidder 
Brand

 Manufacturer's 
Product Code Pack Size

Estimated 
Servings/Pounds 

per Case

Cost Per
Serving

Cost
Per

Case

Required 
Number of 

Cases

Extended
 Total
Cost

Comments
LEAD TIME 

FROM ORDER 
(IN WEEKS)

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 Column 5 Column 6 Column 7 Column 8 Column 9 Column 10 Column 11 Column 12 Column 13 Column 14 Column 16 Column 17 Column 18

Bid Submissions That Deviate From 
What Is Being Requested In The 

Specifications Below Will Be 
Considered A Non Acceptable Vendor 

Response.

PACK SIZES FOR THE 
FOLLOWING SPECIFICATIONS 
REFLECT CURRENT AWARDS.  

ALL PACK SIZES WILL BE 
THOROUGHLY CONSIDERED 

AND EVALUATED.

Items listed are Pre-
Approved Brands, MSCS 
will accept an approved 

equal (1) as long as it 
meets the bid 

specification and (2) 
tested and approved 

through MSCS's Sample 
Submission Process.

ALL SHIP 
LOTS ARE 
IN CASES.

1111 CASE

Pickles, Dill Hamburger, Sliced -  
Resealable plastic jar or a polyselaed 
bag. Contains approx. 1125 smooth or 
crinkles cut slices. Packed to USDA 
Grade A.        
Approximate Pack: Please indicate pack 
size.

Ship Lot: 200 Cases

Bay Valley 127/12822891393
Cajun Chef 
Heinz 5218904
Heinz 10013000658208

800 No Bid 800 $0.00

1374 CASE

Taco Seasoning Mix - Reduced sodium, 
dry seasoning mix with a blend of spices. 
Sodium should be between 140 mg to 
220 mg of sodium per serving. 
Resealable plastic 32 oz..  containers or 
6.6 - 8. oz. packets per case. 

Please indicate packing size.

Ship Lot:  100

No Approved Brands

800

DYMA 
Brands A 
Ventura 
Foods 

Company

1%/10, Net 
30

Chef's 
Companion 58795 6/6.6z Bags 306 $0.033 $10.00 800 $8,000.00

5,000# 
Minimum 
shipment 
required.  
Products 
may be 

combined to 
meet 

minimum 
shipment.  
Pallets can 
be mixed 

when 

3 weeks to 
ensure 

maximum shelf 
life upon 

delivery.  Many 
items produced 

to order 
whenever 
possible.

1919 SERVINGS

Ranch Dressing, Light or Fat Free - 
Prepared, ready to use in 4/1 gallon jars 
per case. Contains no MSG. Creamy 
white color with a touch of garlic, onion, 
spices and black pepper for high quality 
ranch dressing. Should contain no more 
than 3 grams of fat per 2 tablespoons of 
dressing. If packed differently, please 
indicate.

Ship Lot:  200

Marzetti 80088
Naturally Fresh 953465D5061

1,800 No Bid 1800 $0.00



Memphis-Shelby County Schools (MSCS)
Division of Nutrition Services

2025-2026 Miscellaneous Food Bid I
Dry By the Case 

Stock 
Number Unit Description Approved Brand

(Manufacture Product Code)

Estimated Number of 
Cases

(2025-2026)
Bidder Bidder

Terms
Bidder 
Brand

 Manufacturer's 
Product Code Pack Size

Estimated 
Servings/Pounds 

per Case

Cost Per
Serving

Cost
Per

Case

Required 
Number of 

Cases

Extended
 Total
Cost

Comments
LEAD TIME 

FROM ORDER 
(IN WEEKS)

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 Column 5 Column 6 Column 7 Column 8 Column 9 Column 10 Column 11 Column 12 Column 13 Column 14 Column 16 Column 17 Column 18

Bid Submissions That Deviate From 
What Is Being Requested In The 

Specifications Below Will Be 
Considered A Non Acceptable Vendor 

Response.

PACK SIZES FOR THE 
FOLLOWING SPECIFICATIONS 
REFLECT CURRENT AWARDS.  

ALL PACK SIZES WILL BE 
THOROUGHLY CONSIDERED 

AND EVALUATED.

Items listed are Pre-
Approved Brands, MSCS 
will accept an approved 

equal (1) as long as it 
meets the bid 

specification and (2) 
tested and approved 

through MSCS's Sample 
Submission Process.

ALL SHIP 
LOTS ARE 
IN CASES.

2032 CASE

Orange Sauce - Lower sodium orange 
sauce made with soy sauce, sugar, 
water, vinegar, soy sauce and additional 
Asian flavorings. Pre thickened, ready to 
use. Resealable cap. 

Ship Lot: 200 Cases

Kikkoman Orange Sauce 
4139001575

1000 No Bid 1000 $0.00

2304 CASE

Base, Chicken - Shelf stable, low 
sodium chicken base. In paste form.  No 
added MSG.  Gluten free.  Less than 
140mg sodium per serving.  No 
preservatives or artificial flavors.  Made 
from chicken stock to include vegetables 
and herbs.  For hot and cold 
applications.   
Approximate pack - 6/1 lb containers per 
case. Please indicate if packed diferently.                  

Ship Lot: 100 Cases                                                         

Chef's Companion 57463 
Foothill Farms 575T-T0700
Nestle USA Minor 46206

300 No Bid 300 $0.00



Memphis-Shelby County Schools (MSCS)
Division of Nutrition Services

2025-2026 Miscellaneous Bid I
Refrigerated By the Serving

Stock Number Unit Description Approved Brand
(Manufacture Product Code)

Estimated Number of 
Servings 

(2025-2026)
Bidder Bidder

Terms
Bidder
Brand

 Manufacturer's 
Product Code

Pack                                       
Size

Estimated Servings Per 
Case

Cost Per
Servings

Required 
Number of                        

 Cases

Cost per 
Case

Extended Total 
Cost Comments

LEAD TIME FROM 
ORDER 

(IN WEEKS)

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 Column 5 Column 6 Column 7 Column 8 Column 9 Column 10 Column 11 Column 12 Column 13 Column 14 Column 15 Column 16 Column 17

Bid Submissions That Deviate From 
What Is Being Requested In The 

Specifications Below Will Be 
Considered A Non Acceptable 

Vendor Response.

PACK SIZES FOR THE 
FOLLOWING SPECIFICATIONS 
REFLECT CURRENT AWARDS.  

ALL PACK SIZES WILL BE 
THOROUGHLY CONSIDERED 

AND EVALUATED.

Items listed are Pre-Approved 
Brands, MSCS will accept an 
approved equal (1) as long as 
it meets the bid specification 
and (2) tested and approved 

through MSCS's Sample 
Submission Process. To be 

considered for the bid, a 
sample must be submitted 

for any item with no approved 
brand listed.

ALL SHIP LOTS 
ARE IN CASES.

2387 SERVINGS

Butter Flavored Whipped Cups, IW - 
Whipped butter spread, fluffy,airy,  
lightly salted, and ready for spreading or 
topping. Individually wrappped 5 gram 
portion size. Please indicate if pack size. 

Ship Lot: 200 Cases

No Approved Brands

150,000 No Bid #DIV/0! $0.00 #DIV/0! NO BID
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