

Bid Tabulation Sheet

Purchasing Entity: Shelby County Schools
Bid ID: IFB #03192021 Bid Summary
Description: SCS District Wide Bottled Water Distribution
Category: Business Operations
Pending Award:
Bids Due By: 03/19/2021 11:00 AM
Bids Sealed Until: 03/19/2021 11:00 AM
Effective Start Date:
Effective End Date:
Run Date:

Vendor Summary Information

SCS District Wide Bottled Water Distribution

DELIVERY TO 1384 FARMVILLE RD. WEEKLY												
Bid Ranking	Vendor	74 Elementary Schools (13 cases each) 8 oz. \$ Per Case	8 K-8 Schools (25 cases each) 8 oz. \$ Per Case	8 K-8 Schools (25 cases each) 16.9 oz. \$ Per Case	26 Middle Schools (38 cases each) 16.9 oz. \$ Per Case	30 High Schools (33 cases each) 16.9 oz. \$ Per Case	ELEMENTARY WEEKLY TOTAL	K-8 WEEKLY TOTAL 8 OZ.	K-8 WEEKLY TOTAL 16.9 OZ.	MIDDLE SCHOOL WEEKLY TOTAL	HIGH SCHOOL WEEKLY TOTAL	GRAND WEEKLY TOTAL
1	American Paper & Twine (8 oz.-28 per case, 16.9 oz-24 per case)	\$3.04	\$3.04	\$2.81	\$2.81	\$2.81	\$2,924.48	\$608.00	\$562.00	\$2,776.28	\$2,781.90	\$9,652.66
2	The Water Source (8 oz.-28 per case, 16.9 oz-24 per case)	\$3.15	\$3.15	\$3.15	\$3.15	\$3.15	\$3,030.30	\$630.00	\$630.00	\$3,112.20	\$3,118.50	\$10,521.00
3	Ultimate Attire (8 oz.-28 per case, 16.9 oz-24 per case)	\$4.22	\$4.22	\$3.86	\$3.86	\$3.86	\$4,059.64	\$844.00	\$772.00	\$3,813.68	\$3,821.40	\$13,310.72
4	DS Services of America (10 oz.-15 per case, 16.9 oz.-24 per case)	\$5.64 \$7.50	\$5.64 \$7.50	\$4.99	\$4.99	\$4.99	\$5,425.68	\$1,128.00	\$998.00	\$4,930.12	\$4,940.10	\$17,421.90
5	Pepsi Beverages Co. (8 oz.-28 per case, 16.9 oz-24 per case)	\$7.00	\$7.00	\$7.00	\$7.00	\$7.00	\$6,734.00	\$1,400.00	\$1,400.00	\$6,916.00	\$6,930.00	\$23,380.00

American Paper is the lowest warehouse delivery price.

DELIVERY TO SCHOOLS WEEKLY													
Bid Ranking	Vendor	74 Elementary Schools (13 cases each) 8 oz. \$ Per Case	8 K-8 Schools (25 cases each) 8 oz. \$ Per Case	8 K-8 Schools (25 cases each) 16.9 oz. \$ Per Case	26 Middle Schools (38 cases each) 16.9 oz. \$ Per Case	30 High Schools (33 cases each) 16.9 oz. \$ Per Case	ELEMENTARY WEEKLY TOTAL	K-8 WEEKLY TOTAL 8 OZ.	K-8 WEEKLY TOTAL 16.9 OZ.	MIDDLE SCHOOL WEEKLY TOTAL	HIGH SCHOOL WEEKLY TOTAL	GRAND WEEKLY TOTAL	35 Weeks Total
1	American Paper & Twine	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid							
2	The Water Source (8 oz.-28 per case, 16.9 oz-24 per case)	\$4.50	\$4.50	\$4.50	\$4.50	\$4.50	\$4,329.00	\$468.00	\$900.00	\$4,446.00	\$4,455.00	\$14,598.00	\$510,930.00
3	DS Services of America (10 oz.-15 per case, 16.9 oz.-24 per case)	\$5.64 \$7.50	\$5.64 \$7.50	\$4.99	\$4.99	\$4.99	\$5,425.68	\$586.56	\$998.00	\$4,930.12	\$4,940.10	\$16,880.46	\$590,816.10
4	Pepsi Beverages Co. (8 oz.-28 per case, 16.9 oz-24 per case)	\$8.00	\$8.00	\$8.00	\$8.00	\$8.00	\$7,696.00	\$832.00	\$1,600.00	\$7,904.00	\$7,920.00	\$25,952.00	\$908,320.00

Water Source is the lowest school delivery price who verified their pricing. Ultimate Attire cannot meet the delivery price they submitted in their bid.